CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES

BID # 2010-018]

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
AIRGAS ALLIANCE MEDICAL INC. BAY MEDICAL BOB BARKER
SOUTHWEST, INC. DBA ALLMED COMPANY INC. COMPANY, INC.
EL PASO, TX JEFFERSON CITY, MO DALY CITY, CA FUQUAY VARINA, NC
ITEM DESCRIPTION
NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES, LATEX FREE AND
POWDER FREE, 12" LENGTH SEAMLESS, DIGITALCARE
FRONTLINE 12 OR EQUIVALENT
100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE
(MAY BE ORDERED IN MIXED SIZES)
MANUFACTURER MICROFLEX DIGITCARE DIGIT CARE CYPRESS MEDICAL
CATALOG NO. MCR-USE-880 FL-12 FRONTLINE 12 #NPF
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 50 SMALL SIZE $72.00 $3,600.00 $84.00 $4,200.00 $68.99 $3,449.50 $60.35 $3,017.50
CASES (PER CS)
QTY/BOX 100 BX/100 100 100
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX PER CS 10 10
2. 200 MEDIUM SIZE $72.00 | $14,400.00 $84.00 | $16,800.00 | $68.99 | $13,798.00 | $60.35 | $12,070.00
CASES (PER CS)
QTY/BOX 100 BX/100 100 100
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX PER CS 10 10
3. 800 LARGE SIZE $72.00 | $57,600.00 $84.00 | $67,200.00 | $68.99 | $55192.00 | $60.35 | $48,280.00
CASES (PER CS)
QTY/BOX 100 BX/100 100 100
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX PER CS 10 10
4. 700 X-LARGE SIZE $72.00 | $50,400.00 $84.00 | $58,800.00 | $68.99 | $48,293.00 | $60.35 | $42,245.00
CASES (PER CS)
QTY/BOX 100 BX/100 100 100
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX PER CS 10 10

APPROVED BY:

s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

AIRGAS ALLIANCE MEDICAL INC. BAY MEDICAL BOB BARKER
SOUTHWEST, INC. DBA ALLMED COMPANY INC. COMPANY, INC.
EL PASO, TX JEFFERSON CITY, MO DALY CITY, CA FUQUAY VARINA, NC
irem | ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$84.00 $21,000.00
5. 250 XX-LARGE SIZE $72.00 $18,000.00 (PER CS) $68.99 $17,247.50 NO BID
CASES (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $21,800.00) |
QTY/BOX 100 BX/90 90 NONE STATED
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX PER CS 10 NONE STATED
|
6. 100 XXX-LARGE SIZE $72.00 $7,200.00 $84.00 $8,400.00 $68.99 $6,899.00 NO BID
CASES (PER CS)
QTY/BOX 100 BX/90 90 NONE STATED
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BXPER CS 10 NONE STATED
GRAND TOTAL.: $151,200.00 $176,400.00 $144,879.00 $105,612.50

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

AIRGAS ALLIANCE MEDICAL INC. BAY MEDICAL BOB BARKER
SOUTHWEST, INC. DBA ALLMED COMPANY INC. COMPANY, INC.
EL PASO, TX JEFFERSON CITY, MO DALY CITY, CA FUQUAY VARINA, NC

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 1/2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
ROCUREMENT CARD: vEs[X| NoO[ ] ves[X] No[ ] ves[X] No[ ] ves(x] No[ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 7 5-7 ARO (BARRING ANY 5707 10-30
Within consecutive calendar days MANUF. BACK ORDER)

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BOUND TREE CENTRAL TX. MEDICAL EPOLYSTAR, INC. FIRSTLINE GLOVES, INC.
MEDICAL, LLC EQUIP. & SUPPLIES SAN LEANDRO, CA BUELLTON, CA
DUBLIN, OH AUSTIN, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION
NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES, LATEX FREE AND
POWDER FREE, 12" LENGTH SEAMLESS, DIGITALCARE
FRONTLINE 12 OR EQUIVALENT
100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE
(MAY BE ORDERED IN MIXED SIZES)
FIRSTLINE GLOVES, INC.
MANUFACTURER DIGITCARE FRONTLINE 12 NONE STATED SUNNY CARE FLEXTREME NITRILE GLOVE
CATALOG NO. FL12 NONE STATED NONE STATED 1LFTNG-(S-3XL)
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 50 SMALL SIZE $93.30 $4,665.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $42.54 $2,127.00 $77.00 $3,850.00
CASES CASE
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES - CASE 10/CASE 10
2. 200 MEDIUM SIZE $93.30 $18,660.00 $55.00 $11,000.00 $42.54 $8,508.00 $77.00 $15,400.00
CASES CASE
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES - CASE 10/CASE 10
3. 800 LARGE SIZE $93.30 $74,640.00 $55.00 $44,000.00 $42.54 $34,032.00 $77.00 $61,600.00
CASES CASE
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES - CASE 10/CASE 10
4. 700 X-LARGE SIZE $93.30 $65,310.00 $55.00 $38,500.00 $42.54 $29,778.00 $77.00 $53,900.00
CASES CASE
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES - CASE 10/CASE 10

APPROVED BY:

s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BOUND TREE CENTRAL TX. MEDICAL EPOLYSTAR, INC. FIRSTLINE GLOVES, INC.
MEDICAL, LLC EQUIP. & SUPPLIES SAN LEANDRO, CA BUELLTON, CA
DUBLIN, OH AUSTIN, TX
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5. 250 XX-LARGE SIZE $93.30 $23,325.00 $55.00 $13,750.00 $42.54 $10,635.00 $77.00 $19,250.00
CASES CASE
QTY/BOX 90/BOX 100/BOX 100/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES - CASE 10/CASE 10
6. 100 XXX-LARGE SIZE $93.30 $9,330.00 $150.00 $15,000.00 NONE NONE $77.00 $7,700.00
CASES CASE STATED STATED
QTY/BOX 90/BOX 100/BOX NO 100
BOX PER CASE 10 BOXES PER CASE 10/BOXES BID 10
GRAND TOTAL: $195,930.00 $125,000.00 $85,080.00 $161,700.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

NONE STATED

[]

[]
]

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BOUND TREE CENTRAL TX. MEDICAL EPOLYSTAR, INC. FIRSTLINE GLOVES, INC.
MEDICAL, LLC EQUIP. & SUPPLIES SAN LEANDRO, CA BUELLTON, CA
DUBLIN, OH AUSTIN, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NONE STATED NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO

PROCUREMENT CARD: L] L] L] L]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2.3 7 5.7 3

Within

consecutive calendar days

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:

s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES

BID # 2010-018]

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FISHER SCIENTIFIC CO., LLC HENRY SCHEIN ICS MAGID GLOVE &
PITTSBURGH, PA MATRIX MEDICAL WACO, TX SAFETY MFG. CO. LLC.
IRMO, SC CHICAGO, IL
ITEM DESCRIPTION
NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES, LATEX FREE AND
POWDER FREE, 12" LENGTH SEAMLESS, DIGITALCARE
FRONTLINE 12 OR EQUIVALENT
100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE
(MAY BE ORDERED IN MIXED SIZES)
MANUFACTURER MICROFLEX MICROFLEX - SUPRENO EC AMMEX KIM CLARK
CATALOG NO. USE-880 SEC 375 #APEN #S5060
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 50 SMALL SIZE $85.71 $4,285.50 $48.34 $2,417.00 $58.22 $2,911.00 $91.00 $4,550.00
CASES CA.
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 50/BX 100/BX 50
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX/CASE 10/CS 10
2. 200 MEDIUM SIZE $85.71 $17,142.00 $48.34 $9,668.00 $58.22 $11,644.00 $91.00 $18,200.00
CASES CA.
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 50/BX 100/BX 50
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX/CASE 10 BX/CS 10
3. 800 LARGE SIZE $85.71 $68,568.00 $48.34 $38,672.00 $58.22 $46,576.00 $91.00 $72,800.00
CASES CA.
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 50/BX 100/BX 50
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX/CASE 10 BX/CS 10
4. 700 X-LARGE SIZE $85.71 $59,997.00 $48.34 $33,838.00 $58.22 $40,754.00 $91.00 $63,700.00
CASES CA.
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 50/BX 100/BX 50
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX/CASE 10 BX/CS 10

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

s/

9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FISHER SCIENTIFIC CO., LLC HENRY SCHEIN ICS MAGID GLOVE &
PITTSBURGH, PA MATRIX MEDICAL WACO, TX SAFETY MFG. CO. LLC.
IRMO, SC CHICAGO, IL
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5. 250 XX-LARGE SIZE $85.71 $21,427.50 $48.38 $12,095.00 NONE NONE NO BID NONE
CASES STATED STATED STATED
QTY/BOX 100/BOX 50/BX NONE STATED NONE STATED
BOX PER CASE 10 10 BX/CASE NONE STATED NONE STATED
6. 100 XXX-LARGE SIZE $85.71 $8,571.00 NONE NO BID NONE NONE NO BID NONE
CASES STATED STATED STATED STATED
QTY/BOX 100/BOX NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
BOX PER CASE 10 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
GRAND TOTAL: $179,991.00 $96,690.00 $101,885.00 $159,250.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FISHER SCIENTIFIC CO., LLC HENRY SCHEIN IcS MAGID GLOVE &
PITTSBURGH, PA MATRIX MEDICAL WACO, TX SAFETY MFG. CO. LLC.
IRMO, SC CHICAGO, IL
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
ROCUREMENT CARD: vEs[X| NoO[ ] ves[X] No[ ] ves[X] No[ ] ves(x] No[ ]
21 (MOST ITEMS CURRENTLY]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: IN STOCK - 21 DAYS WOULD 2 7-10 3-4

Within consecutive calendar days

BE WORSE CASE DELIVERY)

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

MIDWEST MEDICAL
SUPPLY CO,, LLC

QUADMED, INC.
JACKSONVILLE, FL

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

SOUTHEASTERN

EMERGENC

Y EQUIPMENT]

YOUNGSVILLE, NC

EARTH CITY, MO YOUNGSVILLE, NC (ALTERNATE)
ITEM DESCRIPTION
NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES, LATEX FREE AND
POWDER FREE, 12" LENGTH SEAMLESS, DIGITALCARE
FRONTLINE 12 OR EQUIVALENT
100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE
(MAY BE ORDERED IN MIXED SIZES)
MANUFACTURER DIGITCARE FRONTLINE 12" [KIMBERLY CLARK STERLING NITRILEf MICROFLEX SUPRENO EC |[MICROFLEX ULTRA SENSE EC
CATALOG NO. FL12 AND MICROFLEX SUPRENO EC MXSEC 375 MXUSE 880
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 50 SMALL SIZE $90.36 $4,518.00 $103.00 $5,150.00 $50.69 $2,534.50 $70.00 $3,500.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100 100 50/BOX 50/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 10 10/CASE 10/CASE
2. 200 MEDIUM SIZE $90.36 $18,072.00 $103.00 $20,600.00 $50.69 $10,138.00 $70.00 $14,000.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100 100 50/BOX 50/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 10 10/CASE 10/CASE
3. 800 LARGE SIZE $90.36 $72,288.00 $103.00 $82,400.00 $50.69 $40,552.00 $70.00 $56,000.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100 100 50/BOX 50/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 10 10/CASE 10/CASE
4. 700 X-LARGE SIZE $90.36 $63,252.00 $103.00 $72,100.00 $50.69 $35,483.00 $70.00 $49,000.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100 100 50/BOX 50/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 10 10/CASE 10/CASE

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

s/

9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT

10




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

MIDWEST MEDICAL

QUADMED, INC.

JACKSONVILLE, FL

SOUTHEASTERN

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

SUPPLY CO,, LLC

EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

YOUNGSVILLE, NC

EARTH CITY, MO YOUNGSVILLE, NC (ALTERNATE)
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5. 250 XX-LARGE SIZE $90.36 $22,590.00 $79.95 $19,987.50 $50.69 $12,672.50 $70.00 $17,500.00
CASES (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $39,975.00)
QTY/BOX 90 50 50/BOX 50/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 10 10/CASE 10/CASE
6. 100 XXX-LARGE SIZE $90.36 $9,036.00 NONE NO BID $50.69 $5,069.00 $70.00 $7,000.00
CASES STATED
QTY/BOX 90 NONE STATED 40/BOX 40/BOX
BOX PER CASE 10 NONE STATED 10/CASE 10/CASE
GRAND TOTAL: $189,756.00 $200,237.50 $106,449.00 $147,000.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT

11




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

MIDWEST MEDICAL
SUPPLY CO,, LLC

QUADMED, INC.
JACKSONVILLE, FL

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT

SOUTHEASTERN
EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT
YOUNGSVILLE, NC

EARTH CITY, MO YOUNGSVILLE, NC (ALTERNATE)
PAYMENT TERMS: .25% - 20 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO
PROCUREMENT CARD: L] L] L] L]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2-7 7 5-7 5-7

Within consecutive calendar days

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT

12



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES, LATEX FREE AND
POWDER FREE, 12" LENGTH SEAMLESS, DIGITALCARE
FRONTLINE 12 OR EQUIVALENT
100 GLOVES PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE
(MAY BE ORDERED IN MIXED SIZES)

MANUFACTURER JOHNSON WILSHIRE
CATALOG NO. NONE STATED
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE
1 50 SMALL SIZE $71.60 | $3,580.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10
2. | 200 MEDIUM SIZE $71.60 | $14,320.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10
3. | 800 LARGE SIZE $71.60 | $57,280.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10
4. | 700 X-LARGE SIZE $71.60 | $50,120.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10

APPROVED BY:

s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
QTY. PRICE PRICE
5. | 250 XX-LARGE SIZE $71.60 | $17,900.00
CASES
QTY/BOX 100
BOX PER CASE 10
6. | 100 XXX-LARGE SIZE NO BID NONE
CASES STATED
QTY/BOX NONE STATED

BOX PER CASE

NONE STATED

GRAND TOTAL:

$143,200.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT

14



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 16, 2009

BID # 2010-018]
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX
1% - 10 DAYS (NOT CHECKED
PAYMENT TERMS: 0 NET . éo DAYS )
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: ves(x] No[_]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 7

Within consecutive calendar days

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 22

BIDS RECEIVED: 17

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 1

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___9/25/09

2010-018 NITRILE MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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