CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/IB/IA LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 60 12 OZ. 40/30, TPO DUROMIX $24.95 $1,497.00 NO BID $28.38 $1,702.80 NO BID
EA CONTAINER FLEXIBLE BUMPER | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $3,405.60)
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX 3M
PRODUCT # 40/30 04240 (120 X 60 OZ.)
|
2. 60 12 0Z. 40/40, SEMI RIDGID N/A NO BID $28.38 $1,702.80 NO BID
EA CONTAINER DUROMIX | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $3,405.60)
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX 3M
PRODUCT # 40/40 DISCONTINUED 04240 (120 X 6 OZ.)
|
3. 260 12 OZ. SMC, FIBERGLASS $28.95 $7,527.00 NO BID $28.38 $7,378.80 NO BID
EA CONTAINER 40/50, DUROMIX | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $14,757.60)
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX 3M
PRODUCT # 40/50 04240 (520 X 6 OZ.)
| 15.57
4. 40 12 0Z. 40/60, METAL DUROMIX N/A NO BID (QT) $622.80 NO BID
EA CONTAINER FILLER OR EQUAL | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $233.55)
BRAND OFFERED DISCONTINUED EVERCOAT 889 (QUART X 15)
PRODUCT # 40/60 12 OZ DISCONTINUED
41/88, SMC |
5. 60 12 OZ. FIBERGLASS PANEL $28.95 $1,737.00 NO BID $31.15 $1,869.00 NO BID
EA CONTAINER ADHESIVE DUROMIX | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $3,738.00)
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX 3M
PRODUCT # 4188 08115 (120 X 6 OZ.)
40/56 HD SMC |
6. 60 2KG. DUROMIX GLAZING $14.95 $897.00 NO BID $29.62 $1,777.20 NO BID
EA FILLER OR EQUAL |
BRAND OFFERED PPG UPOL
PRODUCT # DF715 779

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
LKQ ONLINE CORP.
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
7. 60 12 OZ. 4320, FLEXIBLE N/A NO BID $30.97 $1,858.20 NO BID
EA | CONTAINER FOAM DUROMIX |
BRAND OFFERED DISCONTINUED 3M
PRODUCT # 08463
8. 60 12 PK. 4901, TIPS DUROMIX $12.59 $755.40 NO BID $12.07 $724.20 NO BID
EA | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $724.00)
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX 3M
PRODUCT # 4901 04901
9. 180 180 QTS. DUROMIX CLEANER $4.99 $898.20 NO BID $9.57 $1,722.60 NO BID
EA OR EQUAL | (QT)
BRAND OFFERED BULLDOG 3M
PRODUCT # PT. (NOT AVAILABLE IN QTS.) 08984
10. 1000 ROLL MASKING TAPE 2" $5.95 $5,950.00 NO BID $4.13 $4,130.00 $1.99 $1,990.00
EA |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M INTERTAPE
PRODUCT # 6543 06656 PG500
11. 2000 ROLL MASKING TAPE 3/4" $1.89 $3,780.00 NO BID $1.49 $2,980.00 $0.99 $1,980.00
EA |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M INTERTAPE
PRODUCT # 6541 06652 PG500
12. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, $1.97 $492.50 NO BID $5.95 $1,487.50 $6.59 $1,647.50
EA FINE LINE, 1/8" |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 26343 06404 218

APPROVED BY:__/s/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
13. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, $1.97 $492.50 NO BID $5.95 $1,487.50 $4.19 $1,047.50
EA FINE LINE, 1/4" |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 6330 06405 218
14. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, $2.75 $687.50 NO BID $7.72 $1,930.00 $8.49 $2,122.50
EA FINE LINE, 1/2" |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 6332 06408 218
15. 50 ROLL PLASTIC SHEETING, $21.95 $1,097.50 NO BID $25.74 $1,287.00 NO BID
EA 36" X 1,000' |
BRAND OFFERED HG KEYSTONE
PRODUCT # MH12 PS 16C (16' X 350')
16. 50 ROLL MASKING PAPER, $3.15 $157.50 NO BID $1.62 $81.00 NO BID
EA 3" X 1,000 | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $162.00)
BRAND OFFERED KARDOL KEYSTONE
PRODUCT # MP3 003 (3" X 500' X 100 EACH)
17. 60 ROLL MASKING PAPER, $9.32 $559.20 NO BID $5.42 $325.20 $35.99 $2,159.40
EA 12" X 1,000’ | (ROLL)
BRAND OFFERED KARDOL KEYSTONE 3M
PRODUCT # MP12 012 3ROLLS PER LOG 6512
18. 150 ROLL MASKING PAPER, $13.99 $2,098.50 NO BID $8.14 $1,221.00 $51.99 $7,798.50
EA 18 X 1,000’ | (ROLL)
BRAND OFFERED KARDOL KEYSTONE 3M
PRODUCT # PM18 018 2 ROLLS PER LOG 6518

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

s/

8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
19. 100 ROLL MASKING PAPER, $27.98 $2,798.00 NO BID $16.26 $1,626.00 $95.9900 | $9,599.00
EA 36" X 1,000' |
BRAND OFFERED KARDOL KEYSTONE 3M
PRODUCT # MP36 036 ROLL/LOG 6536
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X | $28.18
20. 600 SHEET || 11" 220 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.76 $456.00 NO BID (SLV) $338.16 $0.2051 $123.06
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $338.18)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M PAN-ASIA
PRODUCT # 2007 HIGH QUALITY 02544 (50 SHEETS PER SLEEVE) 789
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X | $28.18
21. 300 SHEET || 11" 400 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.76 $228.00 NO BID (SLV) $169.08 $0.2159 $64.77
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $169.09)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M PAN-ASIA
PRODUCT # 2002 02539 (50 SHEETS PER SLEEVE) 789
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X | $28.18
22. 500 SHEET | 11" 600 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.76 $380.00 NO BID (SLV) $281.80 $0.3309 $165.45
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $281.82)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M NORTON
02537 (50 SHEETS PER
PRODUCT # 2000 SLEEVE) X 10 SLEEVES 66261131620
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X | $51.49
23. 300 SHEET  ||11" 1000 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.56 $168.00 NO BID (SLV) $308.94 $0.4965 $148.95
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $308.81)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M NORTON
02034 (50 SHEETS PER
PRODUCT # 2021 SLEEVE) X 6 SLEEVES 66261131620
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X | $51.49
24, 300 SHEET  ||11" 1500 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.56 $168.00 NO BID (SLV) $308.94 $0.5821 $174.63
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $308.81)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M NORTON
02032 (50 SHEETS PER
PRODUCT # 2023 SLEEVE) X 6 SLEEVES 66261131618

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL

SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
mem [EsT.AaNN] DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | OTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

DISPOSABLE RESPIRATOR $12.98
25. 12 BOX OF ELEMENTS - FOR NORTH N/A NO BID (BOX) $389.40 NO BID
EA 50 RESPIRATOR P/N N7500-83 | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $389.40)
BRAND OFFERED N/A 3M
07048 (20 PER BOX)
PRODUCT # ¥ 30 BOXES
26. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 3" 24 GRIT $34.31 $1,715.50 $28.54 $1,427.00 $35.93 $1,796.50 $15.65 $782.50
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,750.50) (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,796.85)
BRAND OFFERED 3M SHARK 3M STANDARD
PRODUCT # 1408 W324R 01408 (25/BOX) 592501
27. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 2" 24 GRIT $28.96 $1,448.00 $22.92 $1,146.00 $30.33 $1,516.50 $12.505 $625.25
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,516.90)
BRAND OFFERED 3M SHARK 3M STANDARD
PRODUCT # 1398 W224R 01398 (25/BOX) 592401
28. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 3" 50 GRIT $28.42 $1,421.00 $25.54 $1,277.00 $29.76 $1,488.00 $13.785 $689.25
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,488.30)
BRAND OFFERED 3M SHARK 3M STANDARD
PRODUCT # 1406 W350R 01406 (25/BOX) 592401
29. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 2" 50 GRIT $26.02 $1,301.00 $22.92 $1,146.00 $27.26 $1,363.00 | $10.8125 | $540.625
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL
BRAND OFFERED 3M SHARK 3M STANDARD
PRODUCT # 1396 W250R 01396 (25/BOX) 592404
|
30. 150 PKG OF | VIPER BLADE, CUT OFF N/A NO BID $6.44 $966.00 NO BID
EA 5 DISC #77149 25,450 RPM |
BRAND OFFERED ATD
PRODUCT # 8289 (3")

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/BIA LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6",
31 120 ROLL 80 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, $55.72 $6,686.40 NO BID $58.37 $7,004.40 NO BID
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 1443 01443
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6", |
32. 120 ROLL 180 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, |  $51.48 $6,177.60 NO BID $75.48 $9,057.60 NO BID
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 1442 01439
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6", |
33. 120 ROLL 220 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, |  $72.06 $8,647.20 NO BID $75.48 $9,057.60 NO BID
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 1438 01438
|
34. 10 BOX OF STICKIT DISCS, 8" $80.29 $802.90 NO BID $84.11 $841.10 NO BID
EA 50 |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 1549 01549 80 GRIT
|
35. 150 GAL. PAINT/LACQUER THINNER |  $10.85 $1,627.50 N? BID $9.25 $1,387.50 NO BID
EA
BRAND OFFERED OMNI KEYSTONE
PRODUCT # MS251 10G
|
36. 100 BOX OF | SANDPAPER FILE, 36 GRIT |  $24.23 $2,423.00 NO BID $74.94 $3,747.00 NO BID
EA 50 |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 2220 02222 (BOX OF 100) X 50

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
37. 100 BOX OF SANDPAPER FILE, $31.98 $3,198.00 NO BID $66.99 $3,349.50 NO BID
EA 50 40 GRIT |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 2221 02221 (BOX OF 100) X 50
38. 900 BOX OF SANDPAPER FILE, $35.78 $32,202.00 NO BID $50.77 $22,846.50 NO BID
EA 50 80 GRIT |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 2222 02220 (BOX OF 100) X 450
39. 100 BOX OF GRINDING DISCS, 6" $60.92 $6,092.00 NO BID $56.42 $14,105.00 NO BID
EA 50 | (BOX OF 20)
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
05914 (BOX OF 20 - 5"
PRODUCT # 1922 36 GRIT) X 250 BOXES
40. 72 BOX OF SINGLE EDGE $4.95 $356.40 $6.00 $432.00 $3.58 $257.76 $4.99 $359.28
EA 100 RAZOR BLADES
BRAND OFFERED 3M AMERICAN SAFETY RAZOR PBE SPECTRA MILL
PRODUCT # 5010 RAZOR RB RB-009
41. 50 EACH SINGLE SIDED $13.38 $669.00 $7.95 $397.50 $21.38 $1,069.00 NO BID
BUFF PADS, 8"
BRAND OFFERED 3M BUFF N SHINE 3M
PRODUCT # 5713 BU7503G 05703
42. 50 EACH DOUBLE SIDES $20.72 $1,036.00 $19.95 $997.50 $24.06 $1,203.00 NO BID
BUFF PADS, 8'
BRAND OFFERED 3M MALCO EDGE 3M
PRODUCT # 5703 AW810073 05705

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/IBIA LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. ANN. ONIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
No. | QTv. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
43. 60 BOX OF SCOFFING PADS $16.85 $1,011.00 NO BID $17.38 $1,303.50 NO BID
EA 25 |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 7447 07447 (20 PER BOX) X 75
44, 12 GAL. 6065 POLISHING $87.72 $1,052.64 $50.76 $609.12 $88.67 $1,064.04 NO BID
EA COMPOUND
BRAND OFFERED 3M MALCO SWIRL REMOVER 3M
PRODUCT # 6065 AS190201 06065
45, 60 QT. 5990 HAND OR $15.99 $959.40 $19.34 $1,160.40 $16.62 $997.20 NO BID
EA MACHINE GLAZE
BRAND OFFERED 3M MALCO PLUM CRAZY HAND GLAZE 3M
PRODUCT # 5990 AP114732 05990
FIBERGLASS |
46. 96 GAL. REINFORCEMENT N/A NO BID $35.59 $3,416.64 $25.99 $2,495.04
EA 100 DYNA GLASS |
BRAND OFFERED DYNATRON BONDO
PRODUCT # 64 274
47. 125 GAL. BODY FILLER, BONDO $12.49 $1,561.25 NO BID $10.58 $1,322.50 $16.99 $2,123.75
EA |
BRAND OFFERED 3M BONDO KEY-LITE BONDO
PRODUCT # 494 1076 265
48. 20 EACH METAL SPREADERS $2.31 $46.20 NO BID $4.90 $34.30 NO BID
| (PK)
BRAND OFFERED NONE STATED COSTER

PROD

UCT #

1101

1101 3/PK X 7 PKS

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
LKQ ONLINE CORP.
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
49. 20 EACH PLASTIC SPREADERS $.39 $7.80 NO BID $0.21 $4.20 $1.19 $23.80
BRAND OFFERED NONE STATED GLE BONDO
PRODUCT # 1206 GLE1204 357
50. 100 EACH CHEESE GRADERS $1.85 $185.00 NO BID $1.40 $140.00 NO BID
BRAND OFFERED NONE STATED STANLEY
PRODUCT # 21-995 21-29919
51. 250 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, $83.32 $20,830.00 NO BID $197.56 | $49,390.00 NO BID
EA WHITE [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG (OMNI) PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # MTK 90220B 8717A
52. 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, $83.32 $4,166.00 NO BID $197.56 $9,878.00 NO BID
EA DARK BLUE [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG OMNI PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # MTK (190307**B 3362A
53. 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, $83.32 $4,166.00 NO BID $245.36 | $12,268.00 NO BID
EA MEDIUM BLUE [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG OMNI PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # MTK 15004 B 1139498
54, 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, $83.32 $4,166.00 NO BID $197.56 $9,878.00 NO BID
EA LIGHT BLUE [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG OMNI PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # MTK 907701*B 13500A

APPROVED BY:__/s/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
55, 25 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, $83.32 $2,083.00 NO BID $346.06 $8,651.50 NO BID
EA YELLOW [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG OMNI PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # MTK 5513 B 85389D
|
56. 400 GAL. HARDENER, $32.00 $12,800.00 NO BID $67.38 $13,476.00 NO BID
EA DURETHANE, [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG OMNI PPG DEL FLEET
3260 QT (200 QT NEEDED FOR
PRODUCT # MH 167 150 GAL CLEAR COAT)
|
57. 60 PKG. OF 4901, TIPS DUROMIX $11.35 $681.00 NO BID $11.29 $677.40 NO BID
EA 12 |
BRAND OFFERED DUROMIX DUROMIX
PRODUCT # 4901 4901
CLEAR COAT, |
58. 150 GAL. DURETHANE $142.65 | $21,397.50 NO BID $165.55 | $24,832.50 NO BID
EA DU-1001 [PPG] |
BRAND OFFERED PPG PPG DEL FLEET
PRODUCT # DU-1001 (ANTI-GRAFFITI) 3920
| $8.45
59. 75 BOX OF TAC RAGS $25.90 $1,942.50 NO BID (BOX) $1,267.50 NO BID
EA 24 | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,267.20)
BRAND OFFERED DELTRO BOND
CRYPREMA (12 PER BOX)
PRODUCT # DX51 X 150 BOXES
|
60. 100 10z. GRAPPER ADHESIVE $11.19 $1,119.00 NO BID $15.40 $1,540.00 NO BID
EA BOTTLE |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 8155 08155

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

8/24/09
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. ANN. ONIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
MEGA-STICK INSTANT
61. 40 STICK STEEL PATCHING N/A NO BID $10.34 $413.60 NO BID
EA COMPOUND |
BRAND OFFERED N/A EPOXYGATOR
PRODUCT # MTLSTK4
|
62. 80 30 OZ. 3M #05823 FLOWING $23.97 $1,917.60 NO BID $24.55 $2,455.00 NO BID
EA | CONTAINER FINISHING PUTTY |
BRAND OFFERED 3M 3M
PRODUCT # 5824 05824 (24 OZ.) X 100
63. 500 EACH DUST MASK, $.72 $360.00 $.84 $420.00 $12.98 $324.50 $0.4495 $224.75
DOUBLE STRAP (BOX)
BRAND OFFERED 3M GERSON N95 DISP. RESPIRATOR BOND GERSON
PRODUCT # 7048 WPRN95 07048 (BOX OF 20) X 25 BOXES 1730
SPRAY PAINT, $5.64
64. 24 EACH AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] $2.19 $52.56 $4.98 $119.52 (EACH) $135.36 $2.99 $71.76
GLOSSY WHITE (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $26.28)
MALCO GLOSS WHITE
BRAND OFFERED BRITETOUCH ENGINE ENAMEL KRYLON KRYLON
PRODUCT # BT40 AG116420 1501 1501
SPRAY PAINT,
65. 60 12 PK AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] $26.28 $1,576.80 $59.76 $3,585.60 $5.64 $4,060.80 $35.88 $2,152.80
GLOSSY BLACK (EACH)
MALCO GLOSS BLACK
BRAND OFFERED BRITETOUCH ENGINE ENAMEL KRYLON KRYLON
PRODUCT # BT42 AG116520 1601 1601
SPRAY PAINT,
66. 60 12 PK AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] |  $26.29 $1,577.40 $59.76 $3,585.60 $5.49 $3,952.80 $35.88 $2,152.80
SEMI GLOSSY BLACK (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,576.80) (EACH)
MALCO GLOSS BLACK
BRAND OFFERED BRITETOUCH ENGINE ENAMEL DUPLICOLOR KRYLON
PRODUCT # BT55 AS116020 DA1603 R00779

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 11



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282

DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/IB/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL
SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PETRO COAT,
67. 50 GAL. HYDRO-THERM N/A NO BID NO BID
EA INDUSTRIAL COATING |
BRAND OFFERED N/A N/A
PRODUCT #
PETRO COAT, |
68. 50 GAL. HYDRO-THERM N/A NO BID NO BID
EA INDUSTRIAL COATING |
BRAND OFFERED N/A N/A
PRODUCT #
|
69. 50 GAL. CETAL, UV, VARNISH N/A NO BID $98.95 $4,947.50 NO BID
EA FOR WOOD | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $4,947.25)
BRAND OFFERED N/A SIKKENS
PRODUCT # IVA300G
GRAND TOTAL $192,286.95 $16,303.24 $275,196.72 $41,262.87

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO TERM OF
THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE EXTEND THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACTOR FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

< U

< U

< U L

< U U

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

LKQ ONLINE CORP.
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE KEGCO, INC. (D/B/A LKQ MSC INDUSTRIAL

SUPPLY, INC. CORPUS CHRISTI, TX GOVERNMENT SALES) SUPPLY CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 20 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
S e oA, ves[x| n~o| ] ves[x] w~o| ] ves[x] w~o[ | ves[X] w~o[ |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 1 4 1 1-5
Within __ consecutive calendar days. )
W|th|n_ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 24 24 48
order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 60 12 0z. 40/30, TPO DUROMIX NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER FLEXIBLE BUMPER
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
2. 60 12 Oz. 40/40, SEMI RIDGID NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER DUROMIX
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
3. 260 12 0z. SMC, FIBERGLASS NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER 40/50, DUROMIX
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
4. 40 12 0z. 40/60, METAL DUROMIX NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER FILLER OR EQUAL
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
41/88, SMC
5. 60 12 0z. FIBERGLASS PANEL NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER ADHESIVE DUROMIX
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
40/56 HD SMC
6. 60 2KG. DUROMIX GLAZING NO BID NONE STATED
EA FILLER OR EQUAL

BRAND OFFERED

PROD

UCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
7. 60 12 0z. 4320, FLEXIBLE NO BID NONE STATED
EA CONTAINER FOAM DUROMIX
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
8. 60 12 PK. 4901, TIPS DUROMIX NO BID NONE STATED
EA
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
9. 180 180 QTS. DUROMIX CLEANER NO BID NONE STATED
EA OR EQUAL
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
10. 1000 ROLL MASKING TAPE 2" NO BID $3.19 $3,190.00
EA
BRAND OFFERED 3M
PRODUCT # 06535M
11. 2000 ROLL MASKING TAPE 3/4" NO BID $1.23 $2,460.00
EA
BRAND OFFERED 3M
PRODUCT # 06532
12. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA FINE LINE, 1/8"
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
13. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA FINE LINE, 1/4"
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
14. 250 ROLL MASKING TAPE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA FINE LINE, 1/2"
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
15. 50 ROLL PLASTIC SHEETING, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 36" X 1,000
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
16. 50 ROLL MASKING PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 3" X 1,000’
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
17. 60 ROLL MASKING PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 12" X1,000
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
18. 150 ROLL MASKING PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 18 X 1,000
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 16




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
19. 100 ROLL MASKING PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 36" X 1,000
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X
20. 600 SHEET | 11" 220 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.88 $528.00 NONE STATED
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT
PRODUCT # 84254
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X
21. 300 SHEET | 11" 400 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.88 $264.00 NONE STATED
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT
PRODUCT # 84257
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X
22. 500 SHEET | 11" 600 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.88 $440.00 NONE STATED
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT
PRODUCT # 84259
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X
23. 300 SHEET |11" 1000 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER $.88 $264.00 NONE STATED
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT
PRODUCT # 84260A
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 1/2" X
24. 300 SHEET |11" 1500 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER| NO BID NONE STATED
EA ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT CESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | OTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
DISPOSABLE RESPIRATOR
25. 12 BOX OF ELEMENTS - FOR NORTH NO BID NONE STATED
EA 50 RESPIRATOR P/N N7500-83
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
26. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 3" 24 GRIT $1.85 $92.50 $28.57 $1,428.50
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT 3M
PRODUCT # 55277 01408
27. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 2" 24 GRIT $1.45 $72.50 $24.85 $1,242.50
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT 3M
PRODUCT # 55270 1398
28. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 3" 50 GRIT $1.30 $65.00 $23.43 $1,171.50
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL (EA)
BRAND OFFERED SAIT 3M
PRODUCT # 52281 01406
29. 50 BOX OF DISCS, 2" 50 GRIT $1.10 $55.00 $20.85 $1,042.50
EA 25 ROLOC OR EQUAL
BRAND OFFERED SAIT 3M
PRODUCT # 52273 01396
30. 150 PKG OF | VIPER BLADE, CUT OFF NO BID NONE STATED
EA 5 DISC #77149 25,450 RPM

BRAND OFFERED

PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6",
31. 120 ROLL 80 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6",
32. 120 ROLL 180 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6",
33. 120 ROLL 220 GRIT 100 "D" WEIGHT PAPER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA SELF ADHESIVE, OPEN COAT
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
34. 10 BOX OF STICKIT DISCS, 8" NO BID NONE STATED
EA 50
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
35. 150 GAL. PAINT/LACQUER THINNER $16.86 $2,529.00 NONE STATED
EA
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
36. 100 BOX OF || SANDPAPER FILE, 36 GRIT NO BID $27.60 $2,760.00
EA 50
BRAND OFFERED MIRKA
PRODUCT # 23-170-36

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 19




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
37. 100 BOX OF SANDPAPER FILE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA 50 40 GRIT
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
38. 900 BOX OF SANDPAPER FILE, NO BID $16.78 $15,102.00
EA 50 80 GRIT
BRAND OFFERED MIRKA
PRODUCT # 23-170-80
39. 100 BOX OF GRINDING DISCS, 6" NO BID NONE STATED
EA 50
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
40. 72 BOX OF SINGLE EDGE $9.86 $709.92 $3.47 $249.84
EA 100 RAZOR BLADES
BRAND OFFERED STANLEY ASR
PRODUCT # 11-515 67-0208
41. 50 EACH SINGLE SIDED NO BID NONE STATED
BUFF PADS, 8"
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
42. 50 EACH DOUBLE SIDES NO BID NONE STATED
BUFF PADS, 8'
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 20




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
43. 60 BOX OF SCOFFING PADS NO BID NONE STATED
EA 25
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
44, 12 GAL. 6065 POLISHING NO BID NONE STATED
EA COMPOUND
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
45. 60 QT. 5990 HAND OR NO BID NONE STATED
EA MACHINE GLAZE
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
FIBERGLASS
46. 96 GAL. REINFORCEMENT NO BID NONE STATED
EA 100 DYNA GLASS
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
47. 125 GAL. BODY FILLER, BONDO NO BID $14.58 $1,822.50
EA
BRAND OFFERED BONDO
PRODUCT # 265B
48. 20 EACH METAL SPREADERS NO BID NONE STATED

BRAND OFFERED

PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
No. | QTy. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
49. 20 EACH PLASTIC SPREADERS NO BID $1.13 $22.60
BRAND OFFERED BONDO
PRODUCT # 357B
50. 100 EACH CHEESE GRADERS NO BID NONE STATED
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
51. 250 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA WHITE [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
52. 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA DARK BLUE [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
53. 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA MEDIUM BLUE [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
54, 50 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA LIGHT BLUE [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009

BID # 2009-282
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC

SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT CESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
No. | QTv. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
55, 25 GAL. PAINT, DURETHANE, NO BID NONE STATED
EA YELLOW [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
56. 400 GAL. HARDENER, NO BID NONE STATED
EA DURETHANE, [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
57. 60 PKG. OF 4901, TIPS DUROMIX NO BID NONE STATED
EA 12
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
CLEAR COAT,
58. 150 GAL. DURETHANE NO BID NONE STATED
EA DU-1001 [PPG]
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
59. 75 BOX OF TAC RAGS NO BID NONE STATED
EA 24
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
60. 100 10zZ. GRAPPER ADHESIVE NO BID NONE STATED
EA BOTTLE

BRAND OFFERED

PRODUCT #

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09

2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
No. | QTy. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
MEGA-STICK INSTANT
61. 40 STICK STEEL PATCHING NO BID NONE STATED
EA COMPOUND
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
62. 80 30 OZ. 3M #05823 FLOWING NO BID NONE STATED
EA | CONTAINER FINISHING PUTTY
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
63. 500 EACH DUST MASK, NO BID $.66 $330.00
DOUBLE STRAP
BRAND OFFERED KRYLON TOUGH COAT 3M
PRODUCT # 501800 07048
SPRAY PAINT,
64. 24 EACH | AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] $4.98 $119.52 $1.75 $42.00
GLOSSY WHITE (EA)
BRAND OFFERED KRYLON TOUGH COAT KRYLON
PRODUCT # 501770 BT40
SPRAY PAINT,
65. 60 12PK | AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] $4.98 $298.80 $21.00 $1,260.00
GLOSSY BLACK (EA)
BRAND OFFERED KRYLON TOUGH COAT KRYLON
PRODUCT # 503725 BT42
SPRAY PAINT,
66. 60 12PK | AEROSOL CAN [KRYLON] $4.98 $298.80 $21.00 $1,260.00
SEMI GLOSSY BLACK (EA)
BRAND OFFERED KRYLON
PRODUCT # BT55

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 24



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. ANN. . DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PETRO COAT,
67. 50 GAL. HYDRO-THERM NO BID NONE STATED
EA INDUSTRIAL COATING
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
PETRO COAT,
68. 50 GAL. HYDRO-THERM NO BID NONE STATED
EA INDUSTRIAL COATING
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
69. 50 GAL. CETAL, UV, VARNISH NO BID NONE STATED
EA FOR WOOD
BRAND OFFERED
PRODUCT #
GRAND TOTAL $5,737.04 $33,383.94

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO TERM OF
THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE EXTEND THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACTOR FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

]

NO OPTION OFFERED

UK
]

]

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 25



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES BID # 2009-282
BID DATE: AUGUST 11, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
STAFFORD PERFORMANCE INC
SOUTHWESTERN DBA CAR PARTS MACHINE
INDUSTRIAL FASTENERS AND ENGINE SHOP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NOI:I YESD N
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2 4
Within __ consecutive calendar days.
Within _ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 24
order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 16 BIDS RECEIVED: 6 BIDS LOCAL: 15 NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___8/24/09 2009-282 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 26



