
CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 8 29542836 SEAL & GASKET KIT $196.77 $1,574.16 $140.00 $1,120.00 X NONE STATED $212.49 $1,699.92

2. 8 29543315 RETARDER SEAL $151.29 $1,210.32 $135.00 $1,080.00 X NONE STATED $166.19 $1,329.52

3. 8 29535230 GASKET, CHANNEL $6.32 $50.56 $4.71 $37.68 X NONE STATED $7.20 $57.60

4. 8 29503288 GASKET, CONVERTER $18.75 $150.00 $9.23 $73.84 X NONE STATED $21.07 $168.56

5. 80 29528207 PLATE, C3 CLUTCH $20.12 $1,609.60 $12.85 $1,028.00 X NONE STATED $22.19 $1,775.20

6. 72 29536345 PLATE, C3 CLUTCH $13.52 $973.44 $8.68 $624.96 X NONE STATED $14.90 $1,072.80

7. 16 29501424 PLATE, PISTON RETURN $18.58 $297.28 $18.96 $303.36 X NONE STATED $20.47 $327.52

8. 64 29536346 PLATE, C5 CLUTCH $15.26 $976.64 $10.50 $672.00 X NONE STATED $16.80 $1,075.20

9. 56 29536337 PLATE, C5 CLUTCH $21.47 $1,202.32 $20.97 $1,174.32 X NONE STATED $23.65 $1,324.40

10. 8 29544144 DAMPER ASSEMBLY $272.74 $2,181.92 $258.73 $2,069.84 X NONE STATED $300.46 $2,403.68

11. 48 23045588 PLATE, C1 CLUTCH $5.57 $267.36 $6.12 $293.76 X NONE STATED $5.75 $276.00

MUNCIE, INEL PASO, TX

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL SCHAUMBURG, IL MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. AND SUPPLY DBADARTCO TRANSMISSION
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

GROUP I:  ALLISON B400 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS COLUMBUS, IN

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

MUNCIE RECLAMATION

(BIDDER'S NUMBER:  29546243)

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $37.70)

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $1,028.16)

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $2,069.86)

(BIDDER'S ANNUAL TOTAL:  $150.06)

(SUPERCEDED 29546239)

(SUPERCEDED 29546242)

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 1



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

12. 40 29536343 PLATE, C1 CLUTCH $5.57 $222.80 $5.01 $200.40 X NONE STATED $6.44 $257.60

13. 48 29536344 PLATE, C2 CLUTCH $21.66 $1,039.68 $13.90 $667.20 X NONE STATED $23.75 $1,140.00

14. 48 23048628 PLATE, C2 CLUTCH $16.74 $803.52 $16.89 $810.72 X NONE STATED $18.45 $885.60

15. 8 29542025 GEAR SET ASSY $209.74 $1,677.92 $208.72 $1,669.76 X NONE STATED $231.05 $1,848.40

16. 8 29542025 BUSHING, GEAR SET $209.74 $1,677.92 $208.72 $1,669.76 X NONE STATED $231.05 $1,848.40

17. 8 23045812 SLEEVE, $250.72 $2,005.76 $91.25 $730.00 X NONE STATED $276.20 $2,209.60
FRONT SUPPORT

18. 8 29503215 SPRING ASSY $75.16 $601.28 $71.30 $570.40 X NONE STATED $82.80 $662.40

19. 8 29537789 SPRING RETAINER $43.42 $347.36 $41.20 $329.60 X NONE STATED $47.85 $382.80

20. 8 29540483 C4 PISTON $19.34 $154.72 $19.44 $155.52 X NONE STATED $21.30 $170.40

21. 8 29501360 C4 HOUSING $175.19 $1,401.52 $167.20 $1,337.60 X NONE STATED $192.58 $1,540.64

GROUP I:  ALLISON B400 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

SCHAUMBURG, IL MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
COLUMBUS, IN

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

DARTCO TRANSMISSION MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC.
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $200.48)

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $570.43)

AND SUPPLY DBA

MUNCIE, IN

MUNCIE RECLAMATION

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 2



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 25 29502309 OVERHAUL KIT $332.10 $8,302.50 $315.25 $7,881.25 X NONE STATED $365.85 $9,146.25

2. 4 29527788 GEAR ASSY $2,034.66 $8,138.64 $1,930.15 $7,720.60 X NONE STATED $2,241.41 $8,965.64

3. 3 23017218 FORWARD SHAFT ASSY $912.66 $2,737.98 $715.00 $2,145.00 X NONE STATED NO BID NO BID

4. 3 6835605 ATD HUB $335.48 $1,006.44 $165.00 $495.00 X NONE STATED $498.52 $1,495.56

5. 2 6839021 HUB $131.50 $263.00 $95.00 $190.00 X NONE STATED $144.85 $289.70

6. 15 6880866 HOUSING PTO $334.02 $5,010.30 $323.00 $4,845.00 X NONE STATED $367.95 $5,519.25

7. 10 23013499 SHAFT PTO $574.12 $5,741.20 $544.62 $5,446.20 X NONE STATED $632.45 $6,324.50

8. 10 23048511 PLATE $93.96 $939.60 $45.00 $450.00 X NONE STATED $103.50 $1,035.00

9. 110 29537887 PLATE $12.19 $1,340.90 $5.25 $577.50 X NONE STATED $13.41 $1,475.10

10. 15 6836418 PISTON $79.86 $1,197.90 $76.00 $1,140.00 X NONE STATED $87.89 $1,318.35

11. 12 6836419 RETAINER $50.79 $609.48 $48.18 $578.16 X NONE STATED $55.95 $671.40

MUNCIE, IN
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

DARTCO TRANSMISSION MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC.

COLUMBUS, IN

BORDER

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS
INTERNATIONAL

EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

MUNCIE RECLAMATION
AND SUPPLY DBA

SALES & SERVICES, INC. SCHAUMBURG, IL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 3



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

12. 25 6771144 ATD NUT $25.88 $647.00 $14.80 $370.00 X NONE STATED $28.50 $712.50

13. 8 6833213 NUT $124.26 $994.08 $117.89 $943.12 X NONE STATED $136.90 $1,095.20

14. 14 6754513 NUT $34.94 $489.16 $34.15 $478.10 X NONE STATED $37.95 $531.30

15. 10 6883005 BUSHING $38.81 $388.10 $16.80 $168.00 X NONE STATED $42.75 $427.50

$107.46 $322.38
16. 3 450567 BEARING ASSY NO BID NO BID X NONE STATED $119.80 $359.40

*
17. 6 9412664 BEARING ASSY $159.51 $957.06 $151.32 $907.92 $75.11 $450.66 $175.69 $1,054.14

*
18. 5 23041443 BEARING $343.43 $1,717.15 $198.00 $990.00 $179.80 $899.00 $378.26 $1,891.30

*
19. 7 23047953 BEARING $105.16 $736.12 $95.00 $665.00 $78.33 $548.31 $115.85 $810.95

20. 25 29502050 BEARING $27.04 $676.00 $16.00 $400.00 X NONE STATED $29.79 $744.75

21. 14 29502597 KIT $235.29 $3,294.06 $229.00 $3,206.00 X NONE STATED $259.18 $3,628.52

*
22. 18 23041456 BEARING $67.94 $1,222.92 $65.00 $1,170.00 $28.90 $520.20 $74.81 $1,346.58

MUNCIE RECLAMATION

MUNCIE, IN

BORDER MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. AND SUPPLY DBA
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

(QUOTING STK ON 15, PENDING AVAILABILITY)

 * QUOTING ALTERNATE TO ALLISON

INTERNATIONAL SALES & SERVICES, INC. SCHAUMBURG, IL

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS EL PASO, TX COLUMBUS, IN

DARTCO TRANSMISSION

(BIDDER'S NUMBER:  450567)
(BIDDER'S NOTE:  CAN'T ID P/N)

(ATD CROSSED BY BIDDER)

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 4



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

23. 18 29502067 BEARING $425.40 $7,657.20 $405.00 $7,290.00 X NONE STATED $468.19 $8,427.42

*
24. 10 23041457 BEARING $39.08 $390.80 $20.80 $208.00 $40.70 $407.00 $44.38 $443.80

25. 30 6835321 WASHER $2.47 $74.10 $2.44 $73.20 X NONE STATED $2.81 $84.30

26. 8 23010105 ATD GEAR $111.61 $892.88 $105.90 $847.20 X NONE STATED $122.95 $983.60

27. 5 23010107 ATD GEAR $170.18 $850.90 $164.54 $822.70 X NONE STATED $187.45 $937.25

28. 11 23012921 BEARING $5.31 $58.41 $4.25 $46.75 X NONE STATED $5.99 $65.89

29. 10 29506041 BUSHING $6.73 $67.30 $6.40 $64.00 X NONE STATED $7.77 $77.70

GRAND TOTAL: $76,827.26 $67,059.80 $2,825.17 $82,319.09

MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
MUNCIE, IN

SCHAUMBURG, IL

(ATD CROSSED BY BIDDER)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION
BORDER DARTCO TRANSMISSION MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. AND SUPPLY DBA

INTERNATIONAL SALES & SERVICES, INC.

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS EL PASO, TX COLUMBUS, IN

 * QUOTING ALTERNATE TO ALLISON

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 5



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO TERM OF
THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE EXTEND THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACTOR FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within
_____ hours or the next morning.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency. 24

2

NONE STATED

INCREASE PRICES BY AT LEAST 5%)

MUNCIE, IN

MUNCIE RECLAMATION

45 DAYS ARO (DEPENDING 
ON STK)

the US Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt of the contractor of a written
notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of receipt shown on

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

EL PASO, TX COLUMBUS, IN

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

        YES           NO         YES           NO

14

8 NONE STATED NEXT MORNING (IF STK 
AVAILABLE)

CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within _____

1 NONE STATED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

        YES           NO

DARTCO TRANSMISSION MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. AND SUPPLY DBA
SALES & SERVICES, INC. SCHAUMBURG, IL MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

        YES           NO

THE TIME, WITH THE RIGHT TO

24

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

2% - 10 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

30 - 45

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

1 DAY (IF STK AVAILABLE)

NONE STATED

(MCI MAY EXERCISE OPTION YEARS,
BUT BASED ON THE MARKET AT

X X

X X X X

X

X

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 6



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE

1. 8 29542836 SEAL & GASKET KIT $189.70 $1,517.60

2. 8 29543315 RETARDER SEAL $145.85 $1,166.80

3. 8 29535230 GASKET, CHANNEL $6.10 $48.80

4. 8 29503288 GASKET, CONVERTER $18.09 $144.72

5. 80 29528207 PLATE, C3 CLUTCH $19.40 $1,552.00

6. 72 29536345 PLATE, C3 CLUTCH $13.04 $938.88

7. 16 29501424 PLATE, PISTON RETURN $17.91 $286.56

8. 64 29536346 PLATE, C5 CLUTCH $14.71 $941.44

9. 56 29536337 PLATE, C5 CLUTCH $20.70 $1,159.20

10. 8 29544144 DAMPER ASSEMBLY $262.94 $2,103.52

11. 48 23045588 PLATE, C1 CLUTCH $5.02 $240.96

(P/N CHANGED TO:  29546239)

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP I:  ALLISON B400 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS

(P/N CHANGED TO:  29546239)

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 7



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE

12. 40 29536343 PLATE, C1 CLUTCH $5.38 $215.20

13. 48 29536344 PLATE, C2 CLUTCH $20.89 $1,002.72

14. 48 23048628 PLATE, C2 CLUTCH $16.15 $775.20

15. 8 29542025 GEAR SET ASSEY $202.21 $1,617.68

16. 8 29542025 BUSHING, GEAR SET $202.21 $1,617.68

17. 8 23045812 SLEEVE,
FRONT SUPPORT

18. 8 29503215 SPRING ASSY $72.46 $579.68

19. 8 29537789 SPRING RETAINER $41.87 $334.96

20. 8 29540483 C4 PISTON $17.06 $136.48

21. 8 29501360 C4 HOUSING $168.89 $1,351.12

OBSOLETE

(P/N CHANGED TO:  29543065)

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP I:  ALLISON B400 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 8



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE

1. 25 29502309 OVERHAUL KIT $320.17 $8,004.25

2. 4 29527788 GEAR ASSY $1,961.50 $7,846.00

3. 3 23017218 FORWARD SHAFT ASSY $879.84 $2,639.52

4. 3 6835605 ATD HUB $436.27 $1,308.81

5. 2 6839021 HUB $126.77 $253.54

6. 15 6880866 HOUSING PTO $322.01 $4,830.15

7. 10 23013499 SHAFT PTO $553.48 $5,534.80

8. 10 23048511 PLATE $90.59 $905.90

9. 110 29537887 PLATE $11.76 $1,293.60

10. 15 6836418 PISTON $77.00 $1,155.00

11. 12 6836419 RETAINER $48.96 $587.52

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 9



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE

12. 25 6771144 ATD NUT $24.95 $623.75

13. 8 6833213 NUT $119.80 $958.40

14. 14 6754513 NUT $33.70 $471.80

15. 10 6883005 BUSHING $37.41 $374.10

16. 3 450567 BEARING ASSY NONE STATED

17. 6 9412664 BEARING ASSY $153.78 $922.68

18. 5 23041443 BEARING $331.09 $1,655.45

19. 7 23047953 BEARING $101.39 $709.73

20. 25 29502050 BEARING $26.07 $651.75

21. 14 29502597 KIT $226.83 $3,175.62

22. 18 23041456 BEARING $65.50 $1,179.00

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 10



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE

23. 18 29502067 BEARING $410.11 $7,381.98

24. 10 23041457 BEARING $37.68 $376.80

25. 30 6835321 WASHER $2.38 $71.40

26. 8 23010105 ATD GEAR $107.61 $860.88

27. 5 23010107 ATD GEAR $164.07 $820.35

28. 11 23012921 BEARING $5.12 $56.32

29. 10 29506041 BUSHING $6.50 $65.00

GRAND TOTAL: $72,445.30

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NUMBER DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  ALLISON VR731 TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 11



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS BID # 2009-256
BID DATE:  AUGUST 5, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  SUN METRO

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within
_____ hours or the next morning.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency.

BIDS SOLICITED:  22 BIDS RECEIVED:  5 BIDS LOCAL:  9 NO BIDS:  0

STEWART & STEVENSON
EL PASO, TX

NET - 30 DAYS

        YES           NO

consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt of the contractor of a written
notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of receipt shown on
the US Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within _____

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 5

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

24

X

X

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/11/09      2009-256 BUS TRANSMISSION COMPONENTS - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 12


