CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
GROUP |: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(15,950 GALLONS [290 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. SAE 10W MOTOR OIL $575.00 $323.95 $431.00 $812.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX SG10
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DELVAC 1610 DELO 400 131 #067J
2. SAE 30W MOTOR OIL $575.00 $343.75 $407.00 $812.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX SG30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DELVAC 1630 DELO 400 57 #264J
3. SAE 5W20 MOTOR OIL $343.75 $323.95 $410.00 $881.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG 5W20
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL CLEAN SUPREME 121-55 #541J
4. SAE 5W30 MOTOR OIL $343.75 $323.95 $410.00 $881.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG 5W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL CLEAN SUPREME 93-55 #542]
5. SAE 10W30 MOTOR OIL $332.75 $323.95 $410.00 $782.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG10W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL CLEAN SUPREME 59 #285J

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(7,975 GALLONS [145 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. ATF DEXRON I $825.00 $335.00 $417.00 $832.15
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL ATF D/M ATF MD-3 44 #176J
7. MERCON V TRANSMISSION FLUID $825.00 $515.00 $636.00 $2,165.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS M/M TRANS V ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL MERCON V SYN BLEND MULTI-VEHICLE ATF 225-55 #443)
8. ATF+3 TRANSMISSION FLUID $825.00 $695.00 $484.00 NO BID
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL ATF + 4 ATF + 4 223-55
(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)
9. TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID $346.56 $385.00 $326.00 $867.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL FLUID 424 1000 THF 12 #617J

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(2,475 GALLONS [45 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10. UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 $540.00 $402.00 $395.00 $984.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT PTGL GEARCO 85W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILUBE HDT UGL 85-140 85W140-55G #137J
11. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50 $1,375.00 $1,230.00 $803.00 $2,244.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS SYN 50
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DEL VAC SYN TRAN FLUID |DELO SYNTHETIC FLUID 50 219-55 #346J
12. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 $1,375.00 $1,230.00 $803.00 $3,024.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA TECH SYNTHETIC 75W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DEL VAC SYN GEAR OIL ||DELO SYNTHETIC GEAR 80-140 218-55 #329J
(7,480 POUNDS [136 DRUMS] OF THE FOLLOWING)
13. MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, $955.20 $960.00 $1,104.00
NLGI| GRADE-2 BASED GREASE (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID LUBRAPLEX
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILUX EP #2 MOLY DELO HD MOLY 3 EP2 #208J

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP II: TRANSMISSION AND C & RDISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(5,995 GALLONS [109 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. TRANSYND OIL $1,600.00 $845.00 $1,500.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NONE STATED NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DELVAC SYN ATF SYNTHETIC ATF HEAVY DUTY 709701
2. MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC $650.00 $515.00 $656.00
BLEND ATF (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULTI VEHICLE ATF MULTI-VEHICLE ATF 226
(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)
3. ATF+4 $650.00 $695.00 $550.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL ATF + 4 ATF+4 224-55
4. MERCON V $650.00 $515.00 $636.00 $2,165.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS M/M TRANS V ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULTI-VEHICLE ATF MULTI-VEHICLE ATF 225-55 #443)
5. DEXRON VI $925.00 $625.00 $637.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DEXOT ATF DEX VI 228-55

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

7/28/09 2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP II: TRANSMISSION AND C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(1,485 GALLONS [27 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. DTE-18M HYDRAULIC OIL ISO VG100 $481.25 $396.00 $421.00 $749.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA GUARD 100
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE HYD RANDO HDZ 100 310 #006J
7. MOBIL DTE 26 HYDRAULIC OIL $398.75 $285.00 $306.00 $749.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA GUARD 68
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE HYD CHEV. AW 68 43 #005J
8. MOBIL 424 $346.50 $385.00 $1,816.00 $867.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|[CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL FLUID 424 1000 THF 236 #617J
9. HEAT TRANSFER OIL $748.50 $354.85 $909.15
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID FTHTO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILTHERM 603 HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46 #506J
10. POWERTECH (JOHN DEERE J20C-D) $346.50 $585.00 $867.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|[CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
JZOL CHEVRON 1000 THF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL FLUID 424 JZOD CHEVRON SYNTHETIC #617J
ALL WEATHER THF
11. RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE $481.25 $370.15
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|[CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE 18M RANDO HD PREMIUM OIL

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

MV (FORMERLY RYKON)

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC.
EL PASO, TX
(EXXON MOBIL)

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC.
EL PASO, TX
(CHEVRON)

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
IRVING, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

NONE STATED

i

[ ]

d

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 10 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
ves X[ no [ ] | ves[X]no [ | | ves[X]wo [ ] | ves[X]no [ |

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BII?D!ER S PROMISED DELIVERY: . o4 o4 NONE STATED
Within hour or the next morning.
Within hours or overnight after receipt of - 7DAYSARO

— ¢ P 24 24 NONE STATED

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(15,950 GALLONS [290 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. SAE 10W MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $513.96 $374.81
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO FLEET
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DIESEL SUPREME PLUS 10W 10
2. SAE 30W MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $613.49 $398.57
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO FLEET
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DIESEL SUPREME PLUS 30W 30
3. SAE 5W20 MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $499.95 $356.40
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SUPER SELECT 5W20GF-4/SM 5W20
4. SAE 5W30 MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $374.95 $356.40
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SUPER SELECT 5W30GF-4/SM 5W30
5. SAE 10W30 MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $348.39 $349.27
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

SUPER SELECT 10W30GF-4/SM

10W30

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:

7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(7,975 GALLONS [145 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. ATF DEXRON llI NONE STATED $426.85 $361.75
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULTI-TRANSMISSION ATF SUPER ATF
7. MERCON V TRANSMISSION FLUID NONE STATED $476.39
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MERCON V
8. ATF+3 TRANSMISSION FLUID NONE STATED $678.70
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID KENDALL VERSA TRAN
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SYN BLEND ATF
(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)
9. TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER POWERTECH UNIVERSAL POWER TRAN

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(2,475 GALLONS [45 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10. UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 NONE STATED $572.88 $500.14
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

MULTIGEAR SELECT 85W140GL-5

UNIV. GEAR LUBE 85W140

11. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50 NONE STATED $1,758.90 $1,338.26
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MONARCH SYNTRAN PLUS 50W| SYNCON TRITON TRANS 50
12. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 NONE STATED $1,626.24 $1,339.47
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MONARCH SYNGEAR PLUS 80W140 || SYNCON TRITON 80W140
(7,480 POUNDS [136 DRUMS] OF THE FOLLOWING)
13. MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, NONE STATED $666.40 $862.40 $937.44
NLGI| GRADE-2 BASED GREASE (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL || CONOCO CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER CROWN ROYAL MOLY - [|SUPER STAMOLY{ MEGAPLEX XD3
GRAPHITE EP GREASE 2 (1% MOLY) #2 (3% MOLY)

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP Il: TRANSMISSION AND STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(5,995 GALLONS [109 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. TRANSYND OIL $1,481.65 $1,234.20 | $1,301.36
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER CTDR NO BID CONOCO MOBIL
SYNCON HIGH SYNTH.
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 27101 PERFORMANCE ATF ATF
2. MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC NONE STATED $662.95 $730.24 $678.70
BLEND ATF (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL || MOBIL MULTI- } KENDALL VERSA TRAN

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)

MULTI-TRANS PLUS ATF SYNTHETIC
(FULLY SYNTHETIC LUBRICANT)

VEHICLE ATF SYN BLEND ATF

3. ATF+4 NONE STATED $678.70
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID KENDALL VERSA

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

TRAN SYN. BLEND ATF

4, MERCON V NONE STATED $476.39
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MERCON V
5. DEXRON VI NONE STATED $680.63
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID MOBIL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DEXRON VI

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09 2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP II: TRANSMISSION AND STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(1,485 GALLONS [27 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. DTE-18M HYDRAULIC OIL ISO VG100 NONE STATED $548.33 $648.75
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID MOBIL DTE 18M MOBIL DTE 10
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (DISCONTINUED) EXCEL 100
7. MOBIL DTE 26 HYDRAULIC OIL NONE STATED $264.95 $474.56
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL MOBIL DTE 26
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ROZEP AW HYDRAULIC 68 NONE STATED
8. MOBIL 424 NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63 $475.75
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO MOBIL FLUID
POWERTECH UNIVERSAL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER TRACTOR FLUID POWERTRAN 2
9. HEAT TRANSFER OIL NONE STATED $348.48
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO HEAT TRANSFER OIL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER NONE STATED
10. POWERTECH (JOHN DEERE J20C-D) NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63 $475.75
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO MOBIL FLUID
POWERTECH UNIVERSAL TRACTOR POWER TRAN a4
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER FLUID FOR JOHN DEERE
11. RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE NONE STATED $556.60
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO MULTI-PURPOSE R&0O

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

NONE STATED

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:___7/28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

11




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS BID # 2009-235
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

i
i
i

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED |:| |:|

g
i
g

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
YES NO YES NO YES NO
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within hour or the next morning. 24 24 24

Within hours or overnight after receipt of 4 4 4
verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

BIDS SOLICITED: 34 BIDS RECEIVED: 7 BIDS LOCAL: 22 NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:__/s/
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