
CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES

2. P215/60R16 100 TIRES

3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES

4. P225/60R16 260 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

FIRESTONE PURSUIT
079342

A TO Z TIRE &

'098043

$58.26 $69.03
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

BROADWAY MOTORS

PER TIRE

FIRESTONE FR380

BATTERY, INC.
AMARILLO, TX

FIRESTONE
22504

PART A:  TIRES

COOPER TRENDSETTER

(BID #2)

COOPER CS4 TOURING

$49.00$43.02

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PER TIRE

$47.87

077342 GTZ

UNIT PRICE

01307 098043 FR380

$50.00

A TO Z TIRE &

MIDLAND, TX(BID #1) FORT WORTH, TX

BATTERY, INC.
AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER

AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS

$98.75

22504

UNIT PRICE

PER TIRE

$118.87 $118.87

PER TIRE PER TIRE

PER TIRE

$54.76
PER TIRE

FIRESTONE FR380

$54.00
PER TIRE

$99.95

SUMMIT SIEMPRE VI COOPER TRENDSETTER FIRESTONEPRODUCT BRAND
PART NUMBER 104930

061991
PRODUCT BRAND SUMMIT SIEMPRE VI COOPER STARFIRE FIRESTONE

PART NUMBER 104557 34006 095961 FR710

$45.39 $48.00 $58.70 $55.43
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE FR380
PART NUMBER 104949 34015 098329 FR380 098329

PRODUCT BRAND SUMMIT SIEMPRE VI COOPER STARFIRE FIRESTONE

$83.45 $83.45 $74.49 $75.53
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE PURSUIT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22503 22503 067911 PV41 067911

MANUFACTURER COOPER CS4 TOURING COOPER CS4 TOURING FIRESTONE

MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 1



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

6. P225/70R15 400 TIRES

7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES

8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES

9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES

10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES

FIRESTONE DEST. LE
054375

A TO Z TIRE &

PER TIRE

02912

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 21299004 01933 054375 DESTINATION LE
MANUFACTURER NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE

$85.75
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$59.56 $77.51 $85.43

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC.

UNIT PRICE

TIRE CENTER
MIDLAND, TX

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

(BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX
AMARILLO, TX

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1)

PART NUMBER 02912

$52.00 $52.00 $73.96 $72.11
PER TIRE PER TIRE

PRODUCT BRAND COOPER TRENDSETTER COOPER TRENDSETTER FIRESTONE FIRESTONE INDY 500
PER TIRE

068938 PV41 119679

$110.00 $119.74 $152.02 $162.10
PER TIRE PER TIRE

PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON GL83 COOPER RM160 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS560
PER TIRE

PART NUMBER 61128015 92802 160716 FS560 160716

$65.00 $114.93 $85.09 $88.68
PER TIRE PER TIRE

PRODUCT BRAND WESTLAKE SV308 COOPER TOURING 99V FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FIREHAWK
PER TIRE

PART NUMBER 11299238 22511 077325 GTZ GTZ 077325

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$64.00 $64.00 $77.49 $74.45

FIRESTONE INDY 500
118656BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 39637 39637 118656 INDY 500

MANUFACTURER COOPER COBRA COOPER COBRA FIRESTONE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

11. P235/75R15 200 TIRES

12. P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES

13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES

14. P255/70R16 50 TIRES

15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES

FIRESTONE FS560
192982

A TO Z TIRE &

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE
147033BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 21299200 01935 147033 DESTINATION LE

MANUFACTURER NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE

COOPER RM10

PRODUCT BRAND
PART NUMBER

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$115.89

TOYO OPEN COUNTRY HT COOPER CTS

PRODUCT BRAND
098361

$127.35 $141.56 $171.02 $185.00

FIRESTONE FR380
PART NUMBER 34017 098361 FR380

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED)
UNIT PRICE

$51.95 $51.95 $69.75 $65.11

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

TIRE CENTER
(BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX

FIRESTONE
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

34017

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS

PER TIRE

COOPER STARFIRE COOPER STARFIRE

PER TIRE

PART NUMBER 61108020 95801 169981 FS560
PRODUCT BRAND

95801
SAMSON GL83 COOPER RM170 FIRESTONE

FIRESTONE FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE

$103.00 $123.96 $112.93
PER TIRE

083190

$68.71 $89.44 $84.83 $83.96

362430 04618 083190 DESTINATION LE

$195.50
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$148.69 $157.39 $205.02

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 88025 92322 192982 FS560
MANUFACTURER SAMSON GL83 COOPER ROADMASTER RM120 FIRESTONE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES

17. P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  LOAD RANGE L 20-PLY)

18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES

19. P425/65R22.5 15 TIRES

20. P445/65R22.5 15 TIRES

287954
BRIDGESTONE M8RRF

A TO Z TIRE &

PER TIRE PER TIRE

294594

$516.00 $516.00 $411.09 $350.78

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 0096 549090 394594 T839

PER TIRE

MANUFACTURER ROADLUX R128 TOYO M320 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE T839
PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE BRIDGESTONE M844F
PART NUMBER

$363.50

0091 549070 294586 287938

$370.00 $469.31

PRODUCT BRAND ROADLUX R128 TOYO M320

784604 91822

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$290.00

FIRESTONE FS400

$289.30
PER TIRE

PART NUMBER

PER TIRE
$369.95

216109

PART NUMBER

PRODUCT BRAND TOYO M320 COOPER ROADMASTER RM185

$389.39 $258.60

PRODUCT BRAND COOPER ROADMASTER RM 185 COOPER  ROADMASTER RM185

(BID #1) (BID #2)

$201.38 $201.38

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED)
AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX TIRE CENTERDISTRIBUTORS

FORT WORTH, TX

BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
A TO Z TIRE &

MIDLAND, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

$254.40 $336.49

92045 92045 156590 FS560 296937
FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS590

PER TIRE

PER TIRE PER TIRE

BRIDGESTONE

$439.31 $322.09

186301 M860

$307.32

$357.95

PER TIRE

PER TIRE PER TIRE

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 596748 596748 287954 M844F
MANUFACTURER KUMHO 943 KUMHO 943 BRIDGESTONE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  WHITE NON MARKING)

22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES

23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

24. 12R20 5 TIRES

25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  L-3)

BRIDGESTONE VUT
293954

TIRE CENTER

PER TIRE

A TO Z TIRE &

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 41401 1117184241 293954 VUT

PER TIRE PER TIRE

MANUFACTURER SAMSON G2 DOUBLE COIN REM-8 BRIDGESTONE

MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$1,156.00

PRODUCT BRAND
PART NUMBER

$415.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

COOPER ROADMASTER RM185 COOPER ROADMASTER RM185 FIRESTONE

294497 T819 T819 294497

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$184.70 $184.70 $220.00 $224.64

PRODUCT BRAND
PART NUMBER 61188865 61188865

PRODUCT BRAND
PART NUMBER

PER TIRE PER TIRE

CARLISLE ST CARLISLE ST

$235.00 $235.00

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED)

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

(BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX

$12.00 $12.00 $88.25

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
A TO Z TIRE &

MIDLAND, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

$110.00

TITAN CHEN SHIN WHITE
559056 559056 499018 499018

$248.00 $244.78

SAMSON GL88 SAMSON GL88 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE
PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE FS560
92034 92034 156531 FS560 156531

$327.00 $327.00

SAMSON GL74 SAMSON GL74 NO BID

$550.00 $695.00 $889.35

GOODYEAR 6386
87480 78480 138389427

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES

27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES

28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES

29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES

30. LT245/75R16 60 TIRES

189769
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

PER TIRE

TIRE CENTER
MIDLAND, TX

425129

A TO Z TIRE &

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 624575 51404 189769 TRANSFORCE HT
MANUFACTURER GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS

AMARILLO, TX
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

$472.80 $472.80 $557.00 $509.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON L2 SAMSON L2 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE SURE GRIP
PART NUMBER 306852 306852 425537 SRG

$65.65 $93.35 $87.93 $98.26
PER TIRE

PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON AR110 COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

PART NUMBER 75210 51411 189701 TRANSFORCE HT 189565

$61.91 $91.24 $76.08 $79.15
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 1622575 51412 189752 TRANSFORCE HT 189752

PRODUCT BRAND GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE

$58.79 $81.03 $79.93 $79.73
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 75200 51407 189837 TRANSFORCE HT 189837

MANUFACTURER SAMSON AR110 COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE

$69.24 $98.52 $88.93 $92.30
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES

32. LT265/75R16 25 TIRES

33. LT265/70R17 25 TIRES

1. P315/80R22.5 50 TIRES

2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

3. 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES

A TO Z TIRE &

PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING

$110.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)

$106.00 $100.00 NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID $110.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$106.00 $106.00 NO BID $125.00

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 220780 05503 200156 TRANSFORCE HT 200156

PRODUCT BRAND SUMMITT TC A/W COOPER ATR E FIRESTONE
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$100.00 $146.22 $103.44 $107.57

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 626575 64312 189786 TRANSFORCE HT 189786

PRODUCT BRAND GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER SRMII FIRESTONE
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$75.55 $129.24 $86.13 $86.86

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 362620 50554 207483 TRANSFORCE HT 207483

PRODUCT BRAND TOYO OPEN COUNTRY HT COOPER HT FIRESTONE
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

$133.90 $141.75 $98.67 $101.72

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

TIRE CENTER
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

4. P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES

5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

6. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

TIRES CASING MUST BE A VIRGIN CASING WITH NO MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNCTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS.

7. P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES

8. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES

A TO Z TIRE &
PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID $55.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID $95.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$106.00 $100.00 NO BID $150.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

PER TIRE PER TIRE

NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID $150.00

UNIT PRICE

$106.00 $106.00 NO BID $160.00

TIRE CENTER
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX

TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
A TO Z TIRE &

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM

1.

A.

B.

2.

A.

B.

3.

A.

B. NONE STATED

A TO Z TIRE &

PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

NO BID NONE STATED
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES
(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES
ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY,
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
DBA BILL WILLIAMS

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE

PART C:  ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL

NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

NO BID NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL

NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Delivery within _____ consecutive hours.

after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency

of a telephone order from authorized City personne

(CONTRACT RENEWAL WOULD HAVE TO

BE BASED ON MANUFACTURERS

COST INCREASE AT TIME OF RENEWAL.)

A TO Z TIRE &

24 (FOR PASSENGER AND LIGHT TRUCK
TIRES.  TWICE A WEEK FOR LARGER

24 (FOR PASSENGER AND LIGHT TRUCK

TIRES.  7 DAYS FOR RECAPS.)

TIRES.  TWICE A WEEK FOR LARGER

TIRES.  7 DAYS FOR RECAPS.)

NONE STATEDRoadside Service within _____ hour(s) after receipt NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID

24

8

    YES           NO

24

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

    YES           NO    YES           NO     YES           NO

A TO Z TIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS

TIRE CENTER
(BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS

Delivery within _____ hours or the next morning 24 24 24

X X

X

X

X

X X X

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 10



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES

2. P215/60R16 100 TIRES

3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES

4. P225/60R16 260 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22704
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $99.50 NONE STATED

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22703
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $73.57 NONE STATED

PART NUMBER 06313
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $49.73 NONE STATED

PART NUMBER 05835
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $52.61 NONE STATED

PART NUMBER 06308
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $45.34 NONE STATED

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

6. P225/70R15 400 TIRES

7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES

8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES

9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES

10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 59533
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $78.98 NONE STATED

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 39737
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $58.55 NONE STATED

PART NUMBER 22711
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $102.20 NONE STATED

FIRESTONE FS560 PLUS
PART NUMBER 92802 #160716

PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER NO BID
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $133.57 $154.00

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK INDY 500

PART NUMBER 05812 #119679
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $49.82 $73.90

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 12



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

11. P235/75R15 200 TIRES

12. P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES

13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES

14. P255/70R16 50 TIRES

15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES

FIRESTONE FT455 RAD ST
(183836)BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 92322

MANUFACTURER ROADMASTER NO BID
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $172.17 $186.50

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 59535
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $82.30 NONE STATED

PART NUMBER 59507
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $95.29 NONE STATED

FIRESTONE FS560 RAD ST
PART NUMBER 92811 (169981)

PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $158.13 $172.50

PART NUMBER 06315
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $53.69 NONE STATED

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 13



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES

17. P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  LOAD RANGE L 20-PLY)

18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES

19. P425/65R22.5 15 TIRES

20. P445/65R22.5 15 TIRES

BRIDGESTONE M844F
(287954)BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $412.50

FIRESTONE T839
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (294594)

MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $359.50

FIRESTONE T839
PART NUMBER (294586)

PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $323.50

FIRESTONE T819
PART NUMBER 91822 (157147)

PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $296.04 $271.50

FIRESTONE FS560
PART NUMBER 92345 156590

PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $209.59 $226.50

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 14



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  WHITE NON MARKING)

22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES

23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

24. 12R20 5 TIRES

25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  L-3)

BRIDGESTONE VUT
(293954)BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $750.00

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE # 1

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID NONE STATED

GENERAL S360
PART NUMBER (0568371)

PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $214.50

FIRESTONE T819
PART NUMBER (294497)

PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $254.00

PART NUMBER
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID NO BID

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID NONE STATED

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 15



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES

27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES

28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES

29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES

30. LT245/75R16 60 TIRES

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
#189769BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 56704

MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $87.85 $93.50

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 56707
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $72.25 NONE STATED

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56712 #189752

PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $81.36 $80.75

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56711 #189701

PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $83.24 $92.50

FIRESTONE 12PLY SRG
PART NUMBER (425537)

PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $635.00

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 16



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES

32. LT265/75R16 25 TIRES

33. LT265/70R17 25 TIRES

1. P315/80R22.5 50 TIRES

2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

3. 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$190.00 NO BID $104.00 $124.60

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$160.00 NO BID $104.00 $124.60

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$215.00 NO BID $134.00 $157.00

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)
PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING

PART NUMBER 59592
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $128.64 NONE STATED

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56710 #189786

PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $88.57 $90.80

PART NUMBER 59502
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED $118.39 NONE STATED

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 17



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

4. P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES

5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

6. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

TIRES CASING MUST BE A VIRGIN CASING WITH NO MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNCTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS.

7. P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES

8. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

NONE STATED NO BID $60.00 $55.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$60.00 NO BID $70.00 $70.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$170.00 NO BID $115.50 $126.90

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$150.00 NO BID $115.50 $126.90

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
$185.00 NO BID $153.50 $170.35

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PHOENIX, AZ
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) EL PASO, TX

TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 18



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM

1.

A.

B.

2.

A.

B.

3.

A.

B.

(ALL SERVICE CALLS ARE PLUS 
LABOR AT YOUR PRESENT RATE.)

PER SERVICE CALLPER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60.00 NO BID $175.00 $85.00/HR

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 NO BID $100.00 $65.00/HR

(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

$75.00 $65.00/HRAFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60.00 NO BID

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 NO BID $50.00 $32.50/HR

PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60.00 NO BID $75.00 $65.00/HR

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL
ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 NO BID $50.00 $32.50/HR

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL

PHOENIX, AZ
PART C:  ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
REDBURN TIRE COMPANYFORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE &

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

Delivery within _____ consecutive hours.

after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency

of a telephone order from authorized City personne TWO (2)

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

Roadside Service within _____ hour(s) after receipt 1 N/A 2

TWENTY-FOUR (24)
Delivery within _____ hours or the next morning 6 2 1 FOUR (4)

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 6 4 4

NET - 30 DAYS

    YES           NO     YES           NO     YES           NO     YES           NO

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

PHOENIX, AZ
EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO.
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY

X X X

X

X

X X X

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 20



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES

2. P215/60R16 100 TIRES

3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES

4. P225/60R16 260 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  POLICE PURSUIT)

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 732-585-500 732585500
MANUFACTURER EAGLE RS-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$112.00 $112.00

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 732-354-500 732354500
MANUFACTURER EAGLE RS-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$74.50 $74.50

PART NUMBER 402-391-436 137025783
PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$52.41 $61.19

PART NUMBER 738-276-571 738276571
PRODUCT BRAND ASSURANCE FUEL MAX GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$68.97 $68.97

PART NUMBER 402-728-436 402728436
PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$42.48 $46.02

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
THE GOODYEAR TIRE

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 21



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

6. P225/70R15 400 TIRES

7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES

8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES

9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES

10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 402-027-477 402027477
MANUFACTURER INTEGRITY GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$66.66 $70.00

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 116-969-011 732807500
MANUFACTURER EAGLE GT II GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$74.20 $76.00

PART NUMBER 732-002-500 100215277
PRODUCT BRAND EAGLE RS-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$99.00 $96.85

PART NUMBER 139-172-907 139418050
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$219.19 $219.15

PART NUMBER 402-392-436 402392436
PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$55.29 $59.90

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 22



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

11. P235/75R15 200 TIRES

12. P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES

13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES

14. P255/70R16 50 TIRES

15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 756-780-519 756780030
MANUFACTURER G169 GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$232.53 $239.26

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 183-601-418 137840039
MANUFACTURER WRANGLER SR-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$90.19 $91.07

PART NUMBER 183-579-418 183579418
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$107.75 $107.75

PART NUMBER 139-177-907 139415050
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$243.04 $261.43

PART NUMBER 183-406-418 744826802
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$68.47 $90.75

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 23



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES

17. P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  LOAD RANGE L 20-PLY)

18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES

19. P425/65R22.5 15 TIRES

20. P445/65R22.5 15 TIRES

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 759-314-200 759314200
MANUFACTURER G286A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$495.02 $574.22

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 759-313-200 759313200
MANUFACTURER G286A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$438.19 $508.29

PART NUMBER 759-315-200 759315200
PRODUCT BRAND G286A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$392.21 $454.96

PART NUMBER 756-254-420 756254592
PRODUCT BRAND G291 GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$341.17 $275.61

PART NUMBER 756816519
PRODUCT BRAND N/A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE
$318.92

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX

AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 24



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  WHITE NON MARKING)

22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES

23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

24. 12R20 5 TIRES

25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES
(DESCRIPTION:  L-3)

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 152712409
MANUFACTURER NO BID GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$804.00

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 138389427
MANUFACTURER N/A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$417.77

PART NUMBER 138-953-263 271108673
PRODUCT BRAND G316 FUEL MAX DUNLOP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$259.60 $253.78

PART NUMBER 138-376-187 138376187
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$256.89 $297.99

PART NUMBER 659913150
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$20.00

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 25



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES

27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES

28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES

29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES

30. LT245/75R16 60 TIRES

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 744-395-900 366902103
MANUFACTURER WRANGLER HT RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$101.80 $88.96

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 744-826-802 366131103
MANUFACTURER WRANGLER HT RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$76.23 $79.94

PART NUMBER 744-830-900 357943033
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER HT RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$96.42 $103.72

PART NUMBER 744-821-900 357268033
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER HT RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$98.75 $103.60

PART NUMBER 123876458
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$676.80

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 26



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES

32. LT265/75R16 25 TIRES

33. LT265/70R17 25 TIRES

1. P315/80R22.5 50 TIRES

2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

3. 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES
PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $120.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $140.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $140.00

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)
PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING

PART NUMBER 179-696-217 357422231
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$124.10 $138.04

PART NUMBER 179-746-492 357846072
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A RP

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$116.97 $112.32

PART NUMBER 179-636-492 748636189
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A GY

PER TIRE PER TIRE

$124.63 $143.69

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

PART A:  TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 27



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY.

4. P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES

5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES

6. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES

TIRES CASING MUST BE A VIRGIN CASING WITH NO MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNCTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS.

7. P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES

8. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES
PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $75.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $75.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $120.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $140.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE
NO BID $140.00

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
PART B:  RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND & RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 28



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

ITEM

1.

A.

B.

2.

A.

B.

3.

A.

B.
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NO BID $120.00

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NO BID $65.00

(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NO BID $70.00

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NO BID $35.00

PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NO BID $70.00

8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES

MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NO BID $35.00

ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL
PART C:  ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX

AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 29



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE:  JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

Delivery within _____ consecutive hours.

after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency

of a telephone order from authorized City personne

BIDS SOLICITED:  36 BIDS RECEIVED:  10 BIDS LOCAL:  31 NO BIDS:  0

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

Roadside Service within _____ hour(s) after receipt NONE STATED 1 (ONE)

Delivery within _____ hours or the next morning NONE STATED 1 1/2

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: NONE STATED 1 1/2

    YES           NO     YES           NO

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

(ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL

XX

X X

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:     8/6/09      2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 30


