CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

GILLIG LLC

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

PART A: PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS - _%piscount L] | -_55 wbiscount [xI] - 52.5 % DISCOUNT
1: + 10 % MARKUP + _ 9%MARKUP L] + 9% MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the BENDIX PROPRIETARY
BENDIX _Price List or Catalog SEE BELOW NONE STATED NEW PARTS
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number INTERNATIONAL PARTS PRICING NONE STATED M
Dated DIRECT SHIP BOOK 2/1/2009 1/1/2009
12/29/2008
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER DEALER NET ] LIST

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID

BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

GILLIG LLC

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY - opiscount L[] | - 55 wbiscount [X] | - 55 9% Discount
2: REMANUFACTURED + 10 %MARKUP + 9% MARKUP [ ] + % MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the BENDIX PROPRIETARY
BENDIX _Price List or Catalog SEE BELOW NONE STATED REMANUFACTURED
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME) PARTS
List Number INTERNATIONAL PARTS PRICING NONE STATED M
Dated DIRECT SHIP BOOK 2/1/2009 1/1/2009
12/29/2008
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] []
JOBBER ] ] []
DEALER ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER DEALER NET ] LIST
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES NO
OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE X X X
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

GILLIG LLC

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 1 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

DESCRIPTION: PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX5004338 82-10884-002 5004338
la. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $302.83 $302.83 $302.83
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $126.58 $136.27 $158.99
DESCRIPTION: DASH VALVE #276566 DASH VALVE #276566 DASH VALVE #276566
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX276566N 82-27310-000 276566N
1b. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $61.30 $61.30 $61.30
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $25.61 $27.59 $32.18
DESCRIPTION: E-10 BRAKE VALVE #800632 | E-10 BRAKE VALVE #800632 | E-10 BRAKE VALVE #800632
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX800632 82-18426-000 800632
1c. |YOURLIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $321.64 $321.64 $321.64
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $134.44 $144.74 $168.86
DESCRIPTION: MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX5005037 82-20498-000 5005037
1d. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $57.20 $57.20 $57.60
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $23.91 $25.74 $30.03
DESCRIPTION: END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX103980N 82-01889-001 103980N
le. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $43.47 $43.47 $43.47
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $18.17 $19.56 $22.82

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID

BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

GILLIG LLC

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 2 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY REMANUFACTURED PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

DESCRIPTION:
VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX101100RX 82-48821-000 101100RX
2a. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $251.65 $140.85 $251.65
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $99.93 $63.38 $138.41 (NO CORE CHARGE)
DESCRIPTION: R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX103010N 82-42552-000 103010RX
2b. |[YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $110.64 $43.98 $66.44
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $46.24 $19.79 $36.54 ($20.00 CORE CHARGE)
DESCRIPTION: E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE
VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX286171N 82-40078-000 286171X
2c. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $160.30 $58.64 $93.18
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $67.00 $26.39 $51.25 (NO CORE CHARGE)
DESCRIPTION: AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX107794X 82-19107-000 107794RX
2d. |[YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $84.96 $60.67 $84.96
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $19.77 $27.30 $46.73 ($30.00 CORE CHARGE)
DESCRIPTION: AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX104358RX 82-20166-000 104358RX
2e. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $66.59 $49.04 $66.59
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $26.44 $22.07 $36.62 ($25.00 CORE CHARGE)

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

BORDER
INTERNATIONAL

GILLIG LLC

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

X

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES | X | NO

YES | X | NO

YES | X | NO

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

15

N/A

Within hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency.

24

24

NONE STATED

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

NEOPART LLC

NORTH AMERICAN
BUS INDUSTRIES, INC.

PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

PART A: PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS -58.11% DISCOUNT  [x] - 53.86 % DISCOUNT [ x| - 60.15 DISCOUNT [x]
1: +__ %MARKUP ] +___ % MARKUP | +__ % MARKUP ]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the BENDIX PROPRIETARY BENDIX PROPRIETARY
BENDIX _Price List or Catalog NEW PARTS BENDIX NEW PARTS
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number BW1469 BW1469 BW1469
Dated 1/1/2009 2/1/2009 7/1/2008
SERVICE AIR PRODUCTS LIST PRICE
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER L] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR L] L] L]
JOBBER L] L] L]
DEALER L] L] L]
RETAILER L] L]
OTHER [x] LIST [x] SUGGESTED LIST [ NONE STATED

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

NEOPART LLC

NORTH AMERICAN
BUS INDUSTRIES, INC.

PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET ] NET ] NET ]
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY - 58.9% DISCOUNT  [x] - NOBID % DISCOUNT [ | - 61.00 DISCOUNT [x]
2: REMANUFACTURED +__ % MARKUP ] + No BID_ % MARKUP | +__ % MARKUP ]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the BENDIX PROPRIETARY BENDIX PROPRIETARY
BENDIX Price List or Catalog REMANUFACTURED NO BID REMANUFACTURED
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME) PARTS PARTS
List Number BW1465 NO BID BW1465
Dated 1/1/2009 7/1/2008
REMAN. AIR PRODUCTS LIST EXCHANGE PRICE
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] [ ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER [x] LIST [ 1 NOBID [ ] NONE STATED
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES WILL BE NO YES NO YES NO
OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE ELEFCUTF;’gz:‘CEELLY X X X

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

UPON REQUIEST

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

NEOPART LLC

NORTH AMERICAN
BUS INDUSTRIES, INC.

PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 1 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

DESCRIPTION: PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 5004338 5004338 641464
la. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $302.83 $302.83 $302.83
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $126.85 $139.73 $120.68
DESCRIPTION: DASH VALVE #276566€ DASH VALVE #276566€ DASH VALVE #276566€
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 27656N 27566 2445920
1b. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $61.30 $61.30 $61.30
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $25.67 $28.28 $24.43
DESCRIPTION: E-10 BRAKE VALVE #80063Z | E-10 BRAKE VALVE #80063Z || E-10 BRAKE VALVE #800632
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 800632 800632 641925
1c. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $321.64 $321.64 $321.64
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $134.73 $148.40 $128.17
DESCRIPTION: MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 5005037 5005037 641358
1d. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $57.20 $57.20 $57.20
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $23.96 $26.39 $22.79
DESCRIPTION: END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 103980N 103980 641311
le. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $43.47 $43.47 $43.74
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $18.20 $20.06 $17.43

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

NEOPART LLC

NORTH AMERICAN
BUS INDUSTRIES, INC.

PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 2 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY REMANUFACTURED PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

DESCRIPTION:

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 101100X NO BID NONE STATED
2a. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $251.65 NO BID $244.34 (CORELESS)
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $103.42 (ASSUMES GOOD CORE RETURN) NO BID $95.29
DESCRIPTION: R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 103010X NO BID 641570X (CORELESS)
2b. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $66.44 NO BID $62.60
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $27.30 (ASSUMES GOOD CORE RETURN) NO BID $24.41
DESCRIPTION: E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE
' VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 286171RX NO BID N23442R AND N23442C
2c. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $93.18 NO BID $87.79
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $38.29 (ASSUMES GOOD CORE RETURN) NO BID $34.24
DESCRIPTION: AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 107794X NO BID N8800680R AND N8800680C
2d. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $84.96 NO BID $182.73
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $34.91 (ASSUMES GOOD CORE RETURN) NO BID $71.26
DESCRIPTION: AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 104358RX NO BID 104358X AND 104358C
2e. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $66.59 NO BID $62.82
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $27.36 (ASSUMES GOOD CORE RETURN) NO BID $24.50

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

NEOPART LLC

NORTH AMERICAN
BUS INDUSTRIES, INC.

PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.
NO OPTION OFFERED. X
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES I:I NG YES NO I:I YES | | NG | X |
4% SERVICE CHARGE APPLIES TO PCARD
PURCHASES
BI.DD_ER S PROMISEF) DELIVERY: 30 STK-45 3.5 DAYS ARO
Within __ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 14 STK-45 DAYS (NOT HOURS) NONE STATED

order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT

10



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID

BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS
OF TEXAS L.P. dba
RUSH TRUCK CENTER,

STEWART & STEVENSON TRUCK
HOLDINGS LLC dba
ON THE BORDER

TRUCK ENTERPRISES, INC.

EL PASO FREIGHTLINERS OF EL PASO
PART A: PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [] NET [] NET []
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS - 25 % DISCOUNT [x] - 42.0 DISCOUNT [x] - 25 % DISCOUNT [x]
1: + % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP ] + _15 9% MARKUP a

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

BENDIX PROPRIETARY

BENDIX _Price List or Catalog NEW PARTS OTB FREIGHTLINER NONE STATED

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number NONE N/A 2009

Dated STATED FEB, '09 1/1/2009
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:

WHOLESALER L] L] L]

DISTRIBUTOR L] L] L]

JOBBER L] L]

DEALER L] L] L]

RETAILER L] L] L]

OTHER [ 1_NONESTATED [x] RETAIL [ ]

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT

11



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS
OF TEXAS L.P. dba
RUSH TRUCK CENTER,

STEWART & STEVENSON TRUCK
HOLDINGS LLC dba
ON THE BORDER

TRUCK ENTERPRISES, INC.

EL PASO FREIGHTLINERS OF EL PASO
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [] NET [] NET []
ITEM BENDIX PROPRIETARY /S %DISCOUNT [ ] - 55 % DISCOUNT [x] - 25 % DISCOUNT [x]
2: REMANUFACTURED .S % MARKUP [] +___ Y% MARKUP ] + _15 % MARKUP x]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
BENDIX _Price List or Catalog NONE OTB FREIGHTLINER NONE STATED
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME) STATED
List Number NONE N/A NONE STATED
Dated STATED FEB '09 NONE STATED
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL.:
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] []
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER [ ] NONE STATED [x] RETAIL [ ]
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES NO
OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE N/S X X
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT

12



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS
OF TEXAS L.P. dba
RUSH TRUCK CENTER,
EL PASO

STEWART & STEVENSON TRUCK
HOLDINGS LLC dba
ON THE BORDER
FREIGHTLINERS OF EL PASO

TRUCK ENTERPRISES, INC.

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 1 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY NEW PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

DESCRIPTION: PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338 PURGE VALVE #5004338
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX5004338BXW BW-5004338 5004338 - NEW
la. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $172.61 $302.52 $150.88
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $129.46 $127.06 $121.46
DESCRIPTION: DASH VALVE #276566€ DASH VALVE #276566€ DASH VALVE #276566€
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX276566BXW BW-267566N 276566 - NEW
1b. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $34.94 $61.23 $31.69
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $26.21 $25.72 $25.51
DESCRIPTION: E-10 BRAKE VALVE #80063Z | E-10 BRAKE VALVE #80063Z || E-10 BRAKE VALVE #800632
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: NONE STATED BW-800632 800318
1c. |YOURLIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): NONE STATED $321.30 $166.29
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): NONE STATED $134.95 $133.86
DESCRIPTION: MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037 MAINT KIT #5005037
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX5005037 BW-5005037 5005037 - NEW
1d. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $32.60 $57.13 $29.30
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $24.45 $23.99 $23.69
DESCRIPTION: END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980 END COVER KIT #103980
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX103980BXW BW-103980N 103980 - NEW
le. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $24.77 $43.43 $21.66
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $18.58 $18.24 $17.44

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID

BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009

BID # 2009-215
DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS
OF TEXAS L.P. dba
RUSH TRUCK CENTER,
EL PASO

STEWART & STEVENSON TRUCK
HOLDINGS LLC dba
ON THE BORDER
FREIGHTLINERS OF EL PASO

TRUCK ENTERPRISES, INC.

PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION

GROUP 2 - BENDIX PROPRIETARY REMANUFACTURED PARTS

MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

E-10 DUAL BRAKE

DESCRIPTION: VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X VALVE #101100X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX101100BXW BW-OR101100 101100N
2a. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $221.11 $262.71 $197.10
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $165.83 $144.49 $158.70
DESCRIPTION: R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010X|R-14 RELAY VALVE #103010Xx
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BXOR103010BXW BW-OR103010 103010
2b. |[YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $33.80 $44.24 $56.09
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $25.35 $24.33 $45.15
DESCRIPTION: E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE E-6 DUAL BRAKE
VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X VALVE #286171X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX286171BXW BW-OR286171 286171
2c. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $91.37 $62.05 $76.98
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $68.93 $34.13 $61.97
DESCRIPTION: AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X | AD-9 CARTRIDGE #107794X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX107794BXR BW-OR107794 107794
2d. |[YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $45.88 $62.44 $45.75
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $34.41 $34.34 $36.83
DESCRIPTION: AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X | AD-4 CARTRIDGE #104358X
ITEM |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER: BX104358BXW BW-OR104358 BWR104353R
2e. |YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $35.96 $101.69 $32.69
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $26.92 $55.93 $26.26

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009

2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - REBID BID # 2009-215
BID DATE: MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT: SUN METRO
RUSH TRUCK CENTERS STEWART & STEVENSON TRUCK
OF TEXAS L.P. dba HOLDINGS LLC dba TRUCK ENTERPRISES, INC.
RUSH TRUCK CENTER, ON THE BORDER
EL PASO FREIGHTLINERS OF EL PASO

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED. X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS 2% 10 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD. YES NG I:I YES NG I:I YES | X | NO | |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 15 15 1

Within __ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 o4 1

order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

BIDS SOLICITED: 14 BIDS RECEIVED: 9 BIDS LOCAL: 9 NO BIDS:

APPROVED BY:_/S/

DATE:___6/2/2009 2009-215 BENDIX PROPRIETARY AIR BRAKE DEVICES - SUN METRO DEPARTMENT 15




