
CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (FOB ORIGIN) UNIT PRICE (FOB ORIGIN) UNIT PRICE (FOB ORIGIN) UNIT PRICE (FOB ORIGIN)

1. 3,000 $13.50 $12.10 $______________ $______________
TONS PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

2. 3,000 $14.50 $13.75 $______________ $______________
TONS PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

3. 1,000 $27.50 $14.10 $______________ $______________
TONS PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

4. 1,000 $29.50 $15.75 $______________ $______________
TONS PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

$141,000.00 $107,400.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP II:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS -
PAVING ROCK - FOB DESTINATION
ITEM % OF ANN. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
NO. EST./ AREA (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION)

FRANKLIN MOUNTAINS NORTH
1. 20% RIO GRANDE SOUTH $6.00 $18.75 $______________ $______________

WEST SCHUSTER EAST
CITY LIMITS WEST PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON
CITY LIMITS NORTH
FORT BOULEVARD SOUTH

2. 20% NORTH/SOUTH FREEWAY/ EAST $6.00 $17.25 $______________ $______________
NORTHEAST      RAILROAD DR.

FRANKLIN MOUNTAINS WEST PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON
FORT BOULEVARD/I-10 NORTH
RIO GRANDE SOUTH

3. 20% MARLOWE/TROWBRIDGE/ EAST $6.00 $17.25 $______________ $______________
CENTRAL      FONSECA

SCHUSTER WEST PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

PAVING ROCK - FOB ORIGIN
GROUP I:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS -

ITEM DESCRIPTION

PAVING ROCK,
GRADE ( C ) COARSE 3/4"

PAVING ROCK,
GRADE ( F ) FINE 1/2"

RED ROCK, FRANKLIN RED,

BOUNDARIES

NOTE:  GROUP II, ITEMS 1 AND 2, MINIMUM LOAD ORDERS SHALL BE TWELVE (12) TONS.
1.  6,000 TONS (TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATE) PAVING ROCK, GRADE ( F ) FINE, FOB DESTINATION

GRADE ( C ) COARSE

RED ROCK, FRANKLIN RED,
GRADE ( F ) FINE

TOTAL GROUP I

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 1



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP II:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS -
PAVING ROCK - FOB DESTINATION
ITEM % OF ANN. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
NO. EST./ AREA (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION) (FOB DESTINATION)

MONTANA NORTH
4. 20% I-10 SOUTH $6.00 $17.25 $______________ $______________

EAST I CITY LIMITS EAST
AIRWAY WEST PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON
I-10 NORTH
RIO GRANDE SOUTH

5. 20% CITY LIMITS EAST $6.00 $17.25 $______________ $______________
EAST II MARLOWE/TROWBRIDGE/ WEST

     FONSECA PER TON PER TON PER TON PER TON

$36,000.00 $105,300.00 $0.00 $0.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL: NONE STATED) (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $94,950.00)

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$13.85 $24.00 $_______________ $_______________
$19.85 $30.50 $______________ $______________
$19.85 $30.50 $______________ $______________

1. 200 $19.85 $30.50 $______________ $______________
TONS $19.85 $30.50 $______________ $______________

$18,650.00 $29,200.00

UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$360.00 $440.00

NOTE:  GROUP II, ITEMS 1 AND 2, MINIMUM LOAD ORDERS SHALL BE TWELVE (12) TONS.
1.  6,000 TONS (TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATE) PAVING ROCK, GRADE ( F ) FINE, FOB DESTINATION

BOUNDARIES

BUILDING STONE, IN LOADS OF

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

FOB PLANT
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO:
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS

TOTAL GROUP II

DESCRIPTION

TEN (10) TONS OR MORE

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 2



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
NO. QTY./UOM (PER CUBIC YARD) (PER CUBIC YARD) (PER CUBIC YARD) (PER CUBIC YARD)

$93.00 $90.00 $_______________ $_______________
2. 150 $93.00 $90.00 $______________ $______________

CUBIC $93.00 $90.00 $______________ $______________
YARDS $93.00 $90.00 $______________ $______________

$55,800.00 $54,000.00
10

ORDERS UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER)

$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$5,000.00 $4,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

3. 270 $13.50 $11.50 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $19.50 $16.10 $______________ $______________

$19.50 $16.10 $______________ $______________
$19.50 $16.10 $______________ $______________
$19.50 $16.10 $______________ $______________

$24,705.00 $20,493.00
5

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$1,800.00 $2,200.00

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO:

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET

CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
DESCRIPTION

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

3/4" GRAVEL

(2 SACKS), TRANSIT MIX

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

TWO (2) CUBIC YARDS

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 3



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

4. 950
TONS $37.85 $28.60 $_______________ $_______________

$37.85 $28.60 $______________ $______________
$37.85 $28.60 $______________ $______________
$37.85 $28.60 $______________ $______________

$143,830.00 $108,680.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)

$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

5. 5300 $5.50 $4.00 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $11.50 $8.60 $______________ $______________

$11.50 $8.60 $______________ $______________
$11.50 $8.60 $______________ $______________
$11.50 $8.60 $______________ $______________

$272,950.00 $203,520.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

BASE, DRY
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC

SUBTOTAL

(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
SUBTOTAL

DESCRIPTION

CEMENT STABILIZED
BASE MATERIAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 4



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

6. 1000 $6.00 $4.75 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $12.00 $9.35 $_______________ $_______________

$12.00 $9.35 $______________ $______________
$12.00 $9.35 $______________ $______________
$12.00 $9.35 $______________ $______________

$54,000.00 $42,150.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

7. 3000 $17.00 $13.50 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $23.00 $17.90 $______________ $______________

$23.00 $17.90 $______________ $______________
$23.00 $17.90 $______________ $______________
$23.00 $17.90 $______________ $______________

$258,000.00 $201,600.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SCREENING, COLORS:  RED
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

BASE, PROCESSED

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

DESCRIPTION

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FOB PLANT

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 5



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

8. 1000 $12.50 $10.00 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $18.50 $14.60 $_______________ $_______________

$18.50 $14.60 $______________ $______________
$18.50 $14.60 $______________ $______________
$18.50 $14.60 $______________ $______________

$86,500.00 $68,400.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$4,500.00 $5,500.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

9. 1000 $27.00 $34.00 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $33.00 $38.60 $______________ $______________

$33.00 $38.60 $______________ $______________
$33.00 $38.60 $______________ $______________
$33.00 $38.60 $______________ $______________

$159,000.00 $188,400.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

DESCRIPTION

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET

SCREENING, COLORS:  GRAY

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SCREENING, COLORS:  TAN
SUBTOTAL

FOB PLANT
DELIVER (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 6



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD)

10. 175 $112.00 $113.00 $_______________ $_______________
CUBIC $112.00 $113.00 $_______________ $_______________
YARDS $112.00 $113.00 $______________ $______________

$112.00 $113.00 $______________ $______________
$112.00 $113.00 $______________ $______________

$98,000.00 $98,875.00
10

ORDERS UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER)
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD)
$52.00 $30.00 $______________ $______________

$5,000.00 $4,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD)

11. 300 $106.00 $107.00 $_______________ $_______________
CUBIC $106.00 $107.00 $______________ $______________
YARDS $106.00 $107.00 $______________ $______________

$106.00 $107.00 $______________ $______________
$106.00 $107.00 $______________ $______________

$159,000.00 $160,500.00
10

ORDERS UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER) UNIT PRICE (PER ORDER)
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$125.00 $110.00

UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD) UNIT PRICE (PER CUBIC YARD)
$52.00 $36.00 $______________ $______________

$5,000.00 $4,400.00

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FOB PLANT
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

DESCRIPTION

TRANSIT MIX, TYPE B 3/4"
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN
SUBTOTAL

TWO (2) CUBIC YARDS
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

COST OF TINT FOR SLAB WORK

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

COST OF TINT FOR SLAB WORK

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN
TWO (2) CUBIC YARDS

TRANSIT MIX, TYPE A 3/4"

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 7



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

12. 1000 $16.85 $16.50 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $16.85 $16.50 $______________ $______________

$16.85 $16.50 $______________ $______________
$16.85 $16.50 $______________ $______________

$67,400.00 $66,000.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)

$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

13. 3000 $125.00 $12.50 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $132.85 $19.60 $______________ $______________

$132.85 $19.60 $______________ $______________
$132.85 $19.60 $______________ $______________
$132.85 $19.60 $______________ $______________

$1,969,200.00 $272,700.00

$3,410,295.00 $1,562,258.00 $0.00 $0.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL: NONE STATED) (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $276,450.00)

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS STREET
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

DESCRIPTION

EXIT STONE
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDER LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO:

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

TOTAL GROUP III

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

BLASTING ROCK
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 8



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER GALLON) UNIT PRICE (PER GALLON) UNIT PRICE (PER GALLON) UNIT PRICE (PER GALLON)

$5.50 $4.00 $_______________ $_______________
1. 500 NO BID N/A $_______________ $_______________

GALLONS NO BID N/A $______________ $______________
NO BID N/A $______________ $______________
NO BID N/A $______________ $______________

$2,750.00 $2,000.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

2. 100 $89.50 $110.00 $_______________ $_______________
TONS $95.50 $116.00 $______________ $______________

$95.50 $116.00 $______________ $______________
$95.50 $116.00 $______________ $______________
$95.50 $116.00 $______________ $______________

$47,150.00 $57,400.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00

3. 3000 UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)
TONS $79.00 $70.00 $_______________ $_______________

$85.85 $76.00 $______________ $______________
$85.85 $76.00 $______________ $______________
$85.85 $76.00 $______________ $______________
$85.85 $76.00 $______________ $______________

$1,267,200.00 $1,122,000.00
10

LOADS UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD) UNIT PRICE (PER LOAD)
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________
$90.00 $110.00 $______________ $______________

$3,600.00 $4,400.00
$1,324,300.00 $1,190,200.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL: NONE STATED) (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $225,200.00)

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

GROUP IV:  PAVING MATERIALS
DESCRIPTION

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

CSS-1H EMULSION
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

FOB PLANT

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL
HOT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

COLD MIX

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

FOB PLANT

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL
TOTAL GROUP IV

PAVEMENT, FOR PATCHING

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) TONS
(10 TONS = 1 LOAD) DELIVERED TO

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 9



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$15.00 $13.00 $_______________ $_______________
1. 75 $21.85 $17.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $21.85 $17.60 $______________ $______________
$21.85 $17.60 $______________ $______________
$21.85 $17.60 $______________ $______________

$7,680.00 $6,255.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$27.00 $28.00 $_______________ $_______________
2. 100 $33.85 $34.50 $______________ $______________

TONS $33.85 $34.50 $______________ $______________
$33.85 $34.50 $______________ $______________
$33.85 $34.50 $______________ $______________

$16,240.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$17.00 $13.50 $_______________ $_______________
3. 150 $23.85 $18.10 $______________ $______________

TONS $23.85 $18.10 $______________ $______________
$23.85 $18.10 $______________ $______________
$23.85 $18.10 $______________ $______________

$16,860.00 $12,885.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$27.50 $22.00 $_______________ $_______________
4. 75 $34.35 $26.50 $______________ $______________

TONS $34.35 $26.50 $______________ $______________
$34.35 $26.50 $______________ $______________
$34.35 $26.50 $______________ $______________

$12,367.50 $9,600.00

DESCRIPTION

CRUSHED GRAY 3/8"
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

GROUP V:  LANDSCAPE ROCK

DELIVER (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

FOB PLANT
RED BUILDING STONE

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC
SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FRANKLIN RED 3/4" OR EQUAL
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FRANKLIN RED SCREENING
FOB PLANT

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:    6/4/2009      2009-171 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - STREET DEPARTMENT 10



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.

NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$27.50 $19.50 $_______________ $_______________
5. 75 $34.35 $24.96 $______________ $______________

TONS $34.35 $24.96 $______________ $______________
$34.35 $24.96 $______________ $______________
$34.35 $24.96 $______________ $______________

$12,367.50 $8,950.50
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$22.00 $18.50 $_______________ $_______________
6. 75 $28.85 $23.10 $______________ $______________

TONS $28.85 $23.10 $______________ $______________
$28.85 $23.10 $______________ $______________
$28.85 $23.10 $______________ $______________

$10,305.00 $8,317.50
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

NO BID $109.00 $_______________ $_______________
7. 75 NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________

TONS NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $42,855.00

UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)
NO BID $109.00 $_______________ $_______________

8. 75 NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
TONS NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________

NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $115.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $42,855.00

GROUP V:  LANDSCAPE ROCK

DESCRIPTION

FRANKLIN RED 1 1/2" OR EQUAL
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FRANKLIN RED 2" OR EQUAL
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SANTA FE RED 3/4"
SUBTOTAL

FOB PLANT

SUBTOTAL

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SANTA FE RED 1 1/2"
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$37.00 $45.00 $_______________ $_______________
9. 75 $43.85 $49.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $43.85 $49.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $49.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $49.60 $______________ $______________

$15,930.00 $18,255.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$37.00 $44.00 $_______________ $_______________
10. 100 $43.85 $48.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $43.85 $48.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $48.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $48.60 $______________ $______________

$21,240.00 $23,840.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$37.00 $40.00 $_______________ $_______________
11. 50 $43.85 $44.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $43.85 $44.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $44.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $44.60 $______________ $______________

$10,620.00 $10,920.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$37.00 $39.00 $_______________ $_______________
12. 50 $43.85 $43.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $43.85 $43.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $43.60 $______________ $______________
$43.85 $43.60 $______________ $______________

$10,620.00 $10,670.00

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DESCRIPTION

GROUP V:  LANDSCAPE ROCK

MESA RED 3/4"
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

MESA RED 1 1/2"
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

CRYSTAL WHITE 3/4"
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

CRYSTAL WHITE 1 1/2"
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$32.00 $34.00 $_______________ $_______________
13. 75 $38.85 $38.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $38.85 $38.60 $______________ $______________
$38.85 $38.60 $______________ $______________
$38.85 $38.60 $______________ $______________

$14,055.00 $14,130.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$32.00 $33.00 $_______________ $_______________
14. 75 $38.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $38.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$38.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$38.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

$14,055.00 $13,755.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$42.00 $34.00 $_______________ $_______________
15. 50 $48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

$11,870.00 $9,220.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$42.00 $34.00 $_______________ $_______________
16. 75 $48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

TONS $48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________
$48.85 $37.60 $______________ $______________

$17,805.00 $13,830.00

GROUP V:  LANDSCAPE ROCK
DESCRIPTION

DESERT TAN 3/4"
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

DESERT TAN 1 1/2"
SUBTOTAL

FOB PLANT
DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

OFF WHITE 3/4"
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

OFF WHITE 1 1/2"
SUBTOTAL

FOB PLANT
DELIVER (FOB) NWC

DELIVERED (FOB) NEC
DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL

DELIVERED (FOB) MSC
SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM EST. ANN.
NO. QTY./UOM UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$77.00 $51.00 $_______________ $_______________
17. 150 $83.85 $58.00 $______________ $______________

TONS $83.85 $58.00 $______________ $______________
$83.85 $58.00 $______________ $______________
$83.85 $58.00 $______________ $______________

$61,860.00 $42,450.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

NO BID $40.00 $_______________ $_______________
18. 100 NO BID $44.60 $______________ $______________

TONS NO BID $44.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $44.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $44.60 $______________ $______________
NO BID $21,840.00

UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)
$110.00 $60.00 $_______________ $_______________

19. 100 $127.00 $66.00 $______________ $______________
TONS $127.00 $66.00 $______________ $______________

$127.00 $66.00 $______________ $______________
$127.00 $66.00 $______________ $______________

$61,800.00 $32,400.00
UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON) UNIT PRICE (PER TON)

$100.00 $45.00 $_______________ $_______________
20. 50 $117.00 $51.00 $______________ $______________

TONS $117.00 $51.00 $______________ $______________
$117.00 $51.00 $______________ $______________
$117.00 $51.00 $______________ $______________

$28,400.00 $12,450.00
$344,075.00 $355,478.00 $0.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL: NONE STATED) (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $71,350.00)

GROUP V:  LANDSCAPE ROCK

DESCRIPTION

COBBLESTONE 1" TO 6"
FOB PLANT

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

WHITE RIVER ROCK 2"
FOB PLANT

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

FOB PLANT

RED BOULDERS
FOB PLANT

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

SUBTOTAL

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

GRAY BOULDERS

TOTAL GROUP V

DELIVER (FOB) NWC
DELIVERED (FOB) NEC

DELIVERED (FOB) CENTRAL
DELIVERED (FOB) MSC

SUBTOTAL

SUBTOTAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS BID # 2009-171
BID DATE:  MAY 27, 2009 DEPARTMENT:  STREET

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION JOBE 
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

 
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
X

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within __24_ hours after receipt of purchase order.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED:  20 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 BIDS LOCAL:  15 NO BIDS:  0

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

    YES     X         NO     YES              NO    YES              NO   X     YES              NO

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

APPROVED BY:     /S/     
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