
CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$11.37 $62,535.00

1. 5500 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, NAVY BLUE $13.42 $73,810.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

2. 100 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, NAVY BLUE $13.09 $1,309.00 $13.32 $1,332.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

$10.69 $58,795.00 $9.89 $54,395.00

3. 5500 SHIRTS, POLO, MALE, NAVY BLUE NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

$9.89 $989.00
4. 100 SHIRTS, POLO, FEMALE, NAVY BLUE $14.99 $1,499.00

EA POLY/COTTON BLEND NO BID
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

1. 100 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $12.98 $1,298.00 $14.49 $1,449.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

2. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $12.98 $155.76 $14.49 $173.88 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

(ALTERNATE:  DICKIES 2112272NV - $11.49)
NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

($14.45 SIZES 44-60)

($14.35 SIZES 20-24)

ELBECO V610W SENTINEL
ELBECO SP56WH UNISEX

SENTINEL
ELBECO SP56WH UNISEX

ELBECO V610MWH

(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES)
GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM

NONE STATEDTOTAL GROUP I:

EL PASO, TX

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES

CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEARBAZAAR UNIFORMS &
MEN'S STORE

DICKIES

$124,138.00 $130,526.00

RED KAP 211272

DICKIES FP116DN DICKIES
DICKIES 2008

GROUP I:  56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS (FIELD EMPLOYEES)

VF IMAGEWEAR PT2CNV

EL PASO, TX

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I:  $129,742.00)

8900 UNISEX $9.75 = $975.00)

FP111

ANVIL 4603 PORT AUTHORITY
UNISEX $9.75 = $53,625.00)

(MENS $11.86 2XL / $12.86 3XL)
(ALTERNATIVE 8900 GILDAN

SUPERIOR UNIFORMS L500

BRODER K500

SUPERIOR UNIFORMS 61156 PORT AUTHORITY LADIES STYLE

NONE STATED (ALTERNATIVE GILDAN

(ADD 20% FOR SIZES 44 AND ABOVE)

(ALTERNATE #1:  RED KAP SK28NV - $13.79)
(PLEASE ADD AN ADDITIONAL 20%

FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE)

(ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE)

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

NO BID

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 1



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

3. 250 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE $11.27 $2,817.50 $12.87 $3,217.50 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

4. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE $11.27 $135.24 $12.87 $154.44 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

5. 400 SHIRT, MEN'S BLUE, LONG SLEEVE $12.98 $5,192.00 $14.49 $5,796.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

6. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, BLUE, LONG SLEEVE $12.98 $311.52 $14.49 $347.76 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

7. 300 SHIRT, MEN'S LIGHT BLUE, $11.27 $3,381.00 $14.20 $4,260.00 NO BID
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

8. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, LIGHT BLUE, $11.27 $270.48 $14.20 $340.80 NO BID
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

9a. 50 DRESS, JACKET, MEN'S DARK NAVY $74.99 $3,749.50 NO BID
EA BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

9b. 400 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, DARK NAVY $28.29 $11,316.00 NO BID
BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

EL PASO, TX

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED

NONE STATED

EL PASO, TX

DBA WORK WEAR
GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION

ELBECO

ELBECO 8941 NO BID
ELBECO

ELBECO HS1483 LIGHT BLUE

ELBECO DC13820 NO BID

ELBECO HS1483 LIGHT BLUE

ELBECO V6613W SENTINEL

ELBECO SP56MB

ELBECO V6613 SENTINEL

ELBECO SP66WH

ELBECO V613 SENTINEL
ELBECO SP56MB

ELBECO V613

ELBECO V6610W SENTINEL

SENTINEL

ELBECO V6610W SENTINEL
ELBECO SP66WH UNISEX

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 2



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

9c. 50 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, DARK $28.29 $1,414.50 NO BID
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

1. 900 BELT, SMOOTH, BLACK 1 1/2, LEATHER $7.38 $6,642.00 $6.34 $5,706.00 $6.75 $6,075.00 NO BID
EA

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

2. 5500 EXERCISE, SHORTS, NAVY BLUE $7.98 $43,890.00 $7.19 $39,545.00 $7.40 $40,700.00 NO BID
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (S-XL)

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

3. 5500 EXERCISE, T-SHIRT, NAVY BLUE $4.74 $26,070.00 $4.15 $22,825.00 $5.19 $28,545.00 NO BID
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (S-XL)

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

4. 200 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, $3.57 $714.00 $4.99 $998.00 NO BID
EA 100% SILK

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

5. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP WITH $6.87 $5,496.00 $4.59 $3,672.00 $3.97 $3,176.00 NO BID
EA FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

NONE STATED

45050 SAMUEL BROOME

6 PANEL OVERSEAS OTTO 25-022 RCC
IMPORTED OTTO 45058

G230 BRODER 29P

SAM BROOME SAMUEL BROOME NO BID

GILDAN JERZEES 29MP JERZEES

ARROW 25036-2P
122AN
ANVIL

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS

6620 ART 2273 ARTCRAFT
SAMUEL BROOME 6803-40

(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED EL PASO, TX

ELBECO 8945 NO BID

GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE

ANVIL 122
PAU 208 ARROW

EL PASO, TX
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION

ELBECO

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP II:  $15,736.38)
TOTAL GROUP II: NONE STATED $30,041.50 $15,739.38

ART 2273

(PLEASE ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE)

(PLEASE ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE)

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

NO BID

DBA WORK WEAR
SAFETY SHOES

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 3



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

6. 60 SOLID WHITE, CAP, WITH FIRE $6.92 $415.20 $4.59 $275.40 $3.97 $238.20 NO BID
EA DEPARTMENT LOGO

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

1. 900 MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $55.99 $50,391.00 NO BID $40.75 $36,675.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $55.99 $3,359.40 NO BID $40.75 $2,445.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE

MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.

3. 100 SHOES, MALE OXFORD, BLACK, $34.19 $3,419.00 NO BID $32.75 $3,275.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER

MANUFACTURER WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. N422

4. 12 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD, BLACK, $34.19 $410.28 NO BID $32.75 $393.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER

MANUFACTURER WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. N422

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

GROUP IV:  FOOTWEAR

TOTAL GROUP III: $83,227.20

THOROGOOD 804-6190

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS - CONTINUED EL PASO, TX

WEINBRENNER 834-6041

MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR

SAFETY SHOES

WEINBRENNER

NONE STATED

S677

$42,788.00

WEINBRENNER 834-6041
WEINBRENNER

NO BID

WEINBRENNER

WORK ZONE
S677

WORK ZONE

$73,021.40 $78,734.20

6 PANELS OVERSEAS OTTO 25-022 RCC

EL PASO, TX

OTTO 45058

EL PASO, TX

TOTAL GROUP IV: $57,579.68

WEINBRENNER
THOROGOOD 804-6190

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP III:  $95,953.20)

IMPORTED

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 4



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,     *
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,     *
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ hours after receipt of verbal order in
cases of emergency.

48

(* OPTION OFFERED, EXCEPT FOR
RED WINTER JACKETS, GROUP III ITEM 5)

30

YES           NO YES           NO YES           NO

EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

YES           NO

SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX

MEN'S STORE

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

EL PASO, TX
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.
BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR

48

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

15 3030

48 48

XX

X

X

X

X X X X

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 5



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1. 5500 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, NAVY BLUE NO BID $20.00 $110,000.00 $30.85 $169,675.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER FECH
CATALOG NO. #49400

2. 100 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, NAVY BLUE NO BID $20.00 $2,000.00 $30.85 $3,085.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER FECH #49450
CATALOG NO.

$14.69 $80,795.00 (S/S)
3. 5500 SHIRTS, POLO, MALE, NAVY BLUE $10.00 $55,000.00 $11.85 $65,175.00

EA POLY/COTTON BLEND (L/S $21.95)
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER 4603 SHORT SLEEVE
CATALOG NO. ASH CITY #85076 LONG SLEEVE

(S/S)
4. 100 SHIRTS, POLO, FEMALE, NAVY BLUE $14.69 $1,469.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $11.85 $1,185.00

EA POLY/COTTON BLEND (L/S $21.95)
MANUFACTURER ASH CITY #75041 SHORT SLEEVE
CATALOG NO. ASH CITY #75042 LONG SLEEVE

1. 100 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $1,800.00 $13.25 $1,325.00
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP56WH

2. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $216.00 $19.95 $239.40
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #126R5400

3. 250 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $4,500.00 $12.25 $3,062.50
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP66WH

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $180.00)

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE
SI 1007

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE
SI 1006

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE
SI 1005

(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES)
GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM

$239,120.00TOTAL GROUP I: NO BID $82,264.00 $168,000.00

L500 SI 1004

K 500 P 1003

NO BID PORT AUTHORITY STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1002

NO BID PORT AUTHORITY STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1001

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

GROUP I:  56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS (FIELD EMPLOYEES) NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC

(LONG SLEEVE PORT AUTHORITY
K 500 LSP = $18.90)

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 6



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

4. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $216.00 $18.00 $216.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #176R5400

5. 400 SHIRT, MEN'S BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $7,200.00 $13.25 $5,300.00
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP56MB

6. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $432.00 $19.95 $478.80
EA POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #126R5435

7. 300 SHIRT, MEN'S LIGHT BLUE, NO BID $18.00 $5,400.00 $11.45 $3,435.00
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP66MB

8. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, LIGHT BLUE, NO BID $18.00 $432.00 $18.00 $432.00
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 176R5435

9a. 50 DRESS, JACKET, MEN'S DARK NAVY NO BID $100.00 $5,000.00 $87.00 $4,350.00
EA BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER WHALING
CATALOG NO. 211PY

9b. 400 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, DARK NAVY NO BID $20.00 $8,000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00
BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #38200SI 1014

SI 1013

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1012

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1011

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1010

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1009

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1008

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 7



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

9c. 50 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, DARK NO BID $20.00 $1,000.00 $25.00 $1,250.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #38233

1. 900 BELT, SMOOTH, BLACK 1 1/2, LEATHER NO BID $15.00 $13,500.00 $9.95 $8,955.00
EA

MANUFACTURER DUTYMAN
CATALOG NO. #1511

$8.25 $45,375.00
2. 5500 EXERCISE, SHORTS, NAVY BLUE $8.00 $44,000.00 $8.33 $45,815.00

EA 50/50 POLY BLEND
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. #122

$5.18
3. 5500 EXERCISE, T-SHIRT, NAVY BLUE (S-XL) $28,490.00 $8.00 $44,000.00 $4.50 $24,750.00

EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (XXL = $6.68)
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 29MP

4. 200 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, NO BID $12.00 $2,400.00 $2.95 $590.00
EA 100% SILK

MANUFACTURER SAM BROOM
CATALOG NO. 90099

5. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP WITH NO BID $8.00 $6,400.00 $6.00 $4,800.00
EA FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO

MANUFACTURER ALPHA
CATALOG NO. BX002SI 1020

SI 1019

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

STYLE 29MP SI 1018

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

910 PAGE 24 SI 1017

NO BID JERZEES STANDARD ISSUE

SI 1016

NO BID AUGUSTA STANDARD ISSUE

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE

GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS

$34,196.00 $30,088.70
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP II:  $32,576.00)

TOTAL GROUP II: NO BID NO BID

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE
SI 1015

EL PASO, TX
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX

GROUP II:  40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX
ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

(ALTERNATE ANVIL #122 -
$8.05 = $44,275.00)

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 8



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

ITEM EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

6. 60 SOLID WHITE, CAP, WITH FIRE NO BID $8.00 $480.00 $6.00 $360.00
EA DEPARTMENT LOGO

MANUFACTURER ALPHA
CATALOG NO. BX002W

1. 900 MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $45.00 $40,500.00 NO BID $65.00 $58,500.00 $56.00 $50,400.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE

MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD
CATALOG NO. #804-6091

2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $45.00 $2,700.00 NO BID $65.00 $3,900.00 $43.50 $2,610.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE

MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD
CATALOG NO. #804-6086

3. 100 SHOES, MALE OXFORD, BLACK, $40.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $40.00 $4,000.00 $67.50 $6,750.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER (ALT# $32.50)

MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD #834-6905
CATALOG NO. DICKIE #CD4390 ALTERNATE

4. 12 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD, BLACK, $40.00 $480.00 NO BID $40.00 $480.00 $67.50 $810.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER (ALT# $32.50)

MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD #534-6905
CATALOG NO. DICKIE #CD3390 ALTERNATE

$110,780.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $300.00)

$85,270.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE:  $270.00)

$60,570.00
(BIDDER'S GROUP IV TOTAL:  $58,230.00)

TOTAL GROUP IV: $47,680.00 NO BID $66,880.00

CD3290 SI 1026

CD4290 SI 1025

DICKIES STANDARD ISSUE

UNISEX STYLE 5333 SI 1024

DICKIES STANDARD ISSUE

UNISEX STYLE 5333 SI 1023

SLIPGRIPS STANDARD ISSUE

SLIPGRIPS STANDARD ISSUE

GROUP IV:  FOOTWEAR

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP III:  $117,280.00) (BIDDER'S GROUP III TOTAL:  $96,710.00)
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP III:  $72,765.00) ( INCLUDES ITEM 5 THAT WAS DELETED) (INCLUDES ITEM 5 THAT WAS DELETED)

TOTAL GROUP III: NO BID $73,865.00

NO BID STANDARD ISSUE
SI 1022

EL PASO, TX
GROUP III:  MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS - CONTINUED NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX

RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX
ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

APPROVED BY:      /s/      

DATE:      10/28/08       2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 9



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM:  DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE:  OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT:  FIRE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ hours after receipt of verbal order in
cases of emergency.

BIDS SOLICITED:  41 BIDS RECEIVED:  8 BIDS LOCAL:  12 NO BIDS:  1

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

48

30

NONE STATED

YES           NO YES           NO YES           NO

30

YES           NO

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC

7 - 10 DARO

NONE STATED

2% - 10 DAYS

10

48

XX

X

X

X X X X

APPROVED BY:      /s/      
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